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Cover
The matzevah (memorial stone) pictured on the cover is that of Philip Lowenstern.  The stone was one of

the first erected in Urbana in the first Jewish cemetery established in the Champaign-Urbana community.  It was
moved to Mount Hope cemetery around 1899 when all of the burials were transferred and the original Jewish
cemetery was closed.

According to his obituary, Philip Lowenstern was born on October 20, 1804 in Germany.  He raised his
family there in a small town near Göttingen, where his wife died.  Philip was living with his son, Morris, in Urbana
when he died on June 13, 1871.  The pitcher near the top of the matzevah indicates that Philip was a Levite.

Philip’s daughter Bette and son Morris are also buried in Mount Hope.

© 1995, 1999, 2003, 2005, 2006, 2009, 2010, 2013, 2015 Sinai Temple of Champaign-Urbana.  All rights reserved.

Sinai Temple
3104 West Windsor Road

Champaign  IL  61822- 6104

Contact Allen Avner (Phone: 217-352-6889, E-Mail: AAvner@illinois.edu)
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Introduction

Allen Avner

Collection of the information in this report was begun in 1994 by Allen and Elaine Avner who were participating as
volunteers in an international effort to index all Jewish burials.  This project is currently known as the JewishGen
Online Worldwide Burial Registry (JOWBR) and supports  a “...database of names and other identifying
information from Jewish cemeteries and burial records worldwide...”   The information on burials reported here thus
appears in the JOWBR Cemetery Database (http://www.jewishgen.org/databases/cemetery/), which also includes
pictures of all existing monuments. The first edition of this report was produced for the 1994/1995 Sinai Temple
Cemetery Committee.  This ninth edition is based on the original with updates on history, monuments and burials
done by Allen Avner, plus invaluable information kindly shared by the late T.M. Whiteside from his own research on
early Champaign County funeral home, cemetery, and death records.  The first edition of this report was the work of
Allen Avner (monument transcriptions, data verification, historic research, data entry, editor), Elaine Avner
(monument transcriptions, data verification, graphic design), and Tauby Shimkin, then chair of the Cemetery
Committee, (monument transcriptions and data verification).  We thank the relatives of those in the cemetery and the
staffs of Mittendorf-Calvert Funeral Homes, Morgan Memorial Homes, Mount Hope Cemetery, Renner Wikoff
Chapel, and Sinai Temple for their kind and patient aid.  The aid of the staff and resources of the Champaign County
Historical Archives at the Urbana Free Library, the University of Illinois Newspaper Library, and the Illinois
Historical Survey at the University of Illinois Library is also gratefully acknowledged.  Special thanks are owed to
Edythe Davis, Esther Steinberg, Stanford Sholem, Eugene Stern, and Ruth Youngerman and to the late Ruth
Berkson, Audrey Ann & Arnold Leavitt, Norma & Arthur Lewis, and Jack Simon, for their help in identifying
relationships among early families in the community and in suggesting added resources. 

A Brief History of Jewish Cemeteries in Champaign County Illinois

In Champaign County, Illinois, as in many new American Jewish communities in the 19th century, the first Jewish
organization was a burial society (Chevra Kadisha) rather than a congregation. The original minutes of that first
Jewish organization in Champaign County survive as part of the American Jewish Archives at the Cincinnati campus
of Hebrew Union College.  

The minutes, written by Solomon Bernstein, report that on 6 October 1867 “...a number of the Israelites of
Champaign and Urbana...” met at the Champaign home of Max Eichberg and “...resolved to form an association
under the name of Ahavat Achim or ‘Brotherly Love’...”.  The threefold object of Ahavat Achim was “first: to assist
one another in cases of sickness; secondly: to acquire a piece of land for a burial ground, and to contribute equally
for the payment of the purchase money and cost of fencing the same, and thirdly: to cooperate in cases of death in
performing the Mosaic Ritual.”

The list of names subscribing to this resolution includes the heads of many of the pioneer Jewish families of the
community:  Herman Bacharach, Solomon Bernstein, Isaac Bing, Jonas Bing, Max Eichberg, Max M. Eppstein, R.
M. Eppstein, Samuel Eppstein, Henry Hahn, L. Hart, S. Hart, M. Jericho, Joseph Kuhn, Morris Lowenstern, Daniel
Schwarz, Henry Schwarz, Leopold Schwarz, Abraham Stern, and Nathan Stern. 

By the third meeting of the group in early December, 1867, a committee had produced a constitution and bylaws for
Ahavat Achim.  Officers elected for one-year terms at that December meeting were Max Eichberg, President; L. Hart,
Vice President; S. Bernstein, Secretary; M. Lowenstern, Treasurer; and Joseph Kuhn, Representative.  The
constitution indicated some minor changes in the goals of the organization:
   (a) To assist each other in cases of sickness or death.
   (b) To buy an appropriate lot of ground for a burial place.
   (c) To erect, in the course of time, when it shall be decided necessary, a dead house on the said burial ground.

Membership was open to “Any Israelite...twenty one years of age & of good moral standing....” who paid an 
initiation fee of five dollars and dues of one dollar per month.  Members were subject to being expelled for
conviction “...of a criminal offence, or not observing the covenant of Abraham...”   Non-member “Israelites” were to
have the right to bury a member of their family in the Ahavat Achim cemetery on payment of the cost of digging the
grave plus not less than ten dollars nor more than forty dollars.



The Ahavat Achim minutes at the 26 July 1868 meeting reported success in buying “not quite an acre” of land from
Saul Waters, “located in Waters grove about a mile north of Urbana” for $200.  This first Jewish cemetery in
Champaign County was located at what is now the southeast corner of Cunningham Avenue and Perkins Road in
Urbana.  Across the road was the country mansion of Judge J. O. Cunningham, now the site of the Cunningham
Children’s Home.

On 4 November 1869 the bylaws were amended to reduce monthly membership dues from one dollar to 50 cents and
at the 25 September 1870 meeting a motion was passed approving the payment of $187.75 for construction of a
fence around the new cemetery.  

The First Burial

One of the deficiencies of organizational minutes as a source of history is that they sometimes only hint at what must
have been significant events for the organization.  The first burial in the new cemetery in August 1870 is reported in
the September 1870 minutes only in the form of a motion “to send a bill (for $10) to Mr Kahn for the burial of his
child...”.  From her monument we know that Hattie Kahn died on 1 August 1870 at the age of 1 month and 25 days
and was the daughter of Nathan and Hanna Kahn.  A search of the 1870 census revealed that the Kahn family was
from Mattoon, Illinois.  Hattie was days away from her death when her name was captured in the 1870 census for
Mattoon on 29 July 1870.  The census shows Nathan Kahn as a 31 year old merchant and both Nathan and Hanna as
being born in the principality of Baden in what is now Germany.  

Burial of Hattie in Champaign rather than in Mattoon is an indication of the influence of the railroad on the territory
covered by a 19th century rural mid-west Jewish community.  With the coming of the railroad to Champaign - Urbana
in 1855, it became possible for residents of nearby towns to travel to Champaign by train in about the same amount
of time required to travel by horse and carriage across town.  Hence we find the names of residents of towns with
small Jewish populations, such as Farmer City, Mattoon, and Paxton included as active members of many early
Champaign - Urbana Jewish organizations.   

Demographic and Cultural Factors

Examination of the 1870 Federal census for Champaign County reveals that the majority of the founders of Ahavat
Achim were unmarried.  Further, the Champaign - Urbana community contained no identifiable unmarried Jewish
adult females.  In a newly developing community where social services were meager, and in the absence of family,
an organization like Ahavat Achim was probably seen as the only source of compassionate support for these men in
case of sickness or death.  Fraternal organizations served a similar purpose, so it is not surprising that the organizers
of Ahavat Achim were also instrumental in later organizing a local lodge of the international B’nai B’rith in April
1877.

By the time of the 1880 census we can see a substantial change in the makeup of the Champaign - Urbana Jewish
community.  Though there were still unmarried males in the community, the majority of members of Ahavat Achim
had married and had begun families.  

Tragically, these early families faced an infant mortality rate that was far above that seen today.  Of the first 40
persons buried in Jewish cemeteries in Champaign County, 14 were under the age of 13.  Those who survived into
adulthood fared somewhat better, but their mortality rates were still sobering by the standards of today.  The average
age at death for the first 40 burials in the Jewish Cemetery (1870 to 1915) was 36.7 years.  The  median age (the age
at which equal numbers were older or younger) was 41.   The average age at death for the most recent 40 burials in
the Jewish Cemetery (September 2006 to May 2013) was 79.4 years, with a median age of 83.5.  The oldest person
in the early group was 87, only 3.5 years older than the median (midpoint) age of the more recent group. 

The First Change in Management

In March of 1887 membership of Ahavat Achim merged with the membership of Grand Prairie Lodge 281 of B’nai
B’rith, and management of the Jewish Cemetery was taken over by B’nai B’rith.   B’nai B’rith was aided by fund
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raising and maintenance efforts of the Ladies' Hebrew Benevolent Society (from 1889 to about 1891) and the Jewish
Ladies Social Circle (founded in 1894).  

The Cemetery Moves and the Community Grows

In November 1898 the B’nai B’rith lodge proposed moving the Jewish Cemetery to a section within Mount Hope
Cemetery in Champaign.  Records of B’nai B’rith and the women’s organizations do not give a reason for this move,
though possibly it was related to the conversion in 1895 of the home of Judge J. O. Cunningham into an orphanage –
the present-day Cunningham Children’s Home.  On 14 March 1899, 21 8-plot lots were purchased by the B’nai
B’rith lodge from Mount Hope for $300.  Mount Hope Cemetery records show that 15 of the burials in this new
section were re-burials from the old cemetery in Urbana.  After all were moved to Mount Hope in April, 1900, the
old cemetery was closed.  Since then, most Jewish burials in Champaign County have been in Mount Hope.  

As the size and diversity of the Jewish community grew, the special Jewish sections of Mount Hope also grew and
diversified.  As new Jewish organizations became established within the community, operation of the Jewish
cemetery became more of a cooperative activity.  The major populations served have belonged to the Reform
congregation of Sinai Temple (established in 1904 as the “Champaign-Urbana Hebrew Congregation”), the
Orthodox Congregation B'nai Israel (active from 1912 through 1954), and the University of Illinois Hillel
Foundation (established in 1923). 

From 1899 to the present, the area covered by the Jewish section of Mount Hope has been gradually expanded by
purchase of additional land with the income earned from sales of burial rights.  In May 2015, the Jewish sections of
Mount Hope Cemetery consisted of 870 burial spaces and 36 mausoleum spaces containing 421 interments. 

Burial and Ritual Practices

The bylaws of Ahavat Achim specified procedures for burial that depart in some ways from current perceptions of
appropriate Jewish practices.  For example, the bylaws specified that, except in special circumstances, no burial was
to take place before the expiration of 48 hours after death.  Current Jewish practice is that burial should ideally be
performed within 24 hours of death. 

The Ahavat Achim bylaws stated that all members were obligated to attend the funeral of a member or his wife.  In
the case of the death of a child, it was the duty of at least ten members to attend.  Shiva services at the home of the
mourners followed the German Reform practice of beginning on the day of burial and continuing for three days.  All
members were expected to attend these prayer services.

Mention of building a “dead house” at the cemetery suggests that the group planned to follow traditional Ashkenazic
Jewish methods of preparation of the dead near the place of burial in a Bet Tahara (“house of purification”).  Such a
building was added to the first cemetery in the summer of 1871 (at a cost of $128).  Unfortunately, we have no
record of what practices were actually followed by members of the society. 

The late 19th century was a time when funeral and burial practices in all smaller American communities were
undergoing change.  Early 19th century Jewish burial practices were very similar to those used by the general
population in rural America.  The body was minimally prepared (usually in the home) by members of the family and
buried almost immediately with a brief grave-side religious service.  Simple coffins were built at the time of need by
local carpenters or cabinet makers.

These practices began to change during the American Civil War when techniques of embalming and use of mass
produced caskets became more widespread.  Factory made caskets were first added as a sideline to furniture stores. 
Later some of these stores added embalming services to their coffin sideline and began the profession of “Funeral
Undertaking”.  By the late 19th century the preparation of the dead for burial by family and friends was decreasing
even in smaller rural communities and what had begun as a sideline for furniture stores had emerged for some as a
prime source of business.  We read in The Standard Atlas of Champaign County, Illinois (George Ogle, Chicago,
1913) an advertisement for “Mittendorf & Kiler, Undertakers” (the present day Mittendorf - Calvert Funeral Homes)
which lists “Furniture, Carpets, Pictures and Frames” as wares also available. 
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By 1887 the influence of the original members of Ahavat Achim on funeral practices may have waned.  The March
1887 merger of the organization with Grand Prairie Lodge 281 of B’nai B’rith certainly changed the focus of
management of the cemetery.  In addition, Max Eichberg, the founding president of Achavat Achim and probably
one of the major forces behind its activities, was about to leave the community.  

On 27 July 1890, the burial of Julius Bernstein, son of Solomon and Fanny, was handled by the undertaker Asbury
Shuck.  This burial was the first Jewish burial known to be handled by a commercial funeral director.  Like the
Mittendorf family business, Asbury Shuck began as a furniture dealer in Urbana some time after 1870, expanded into
funeral undertaking, and finally became a full time funeral director in a building at the corner of Race and Green
streets in Urbana.  In May 1909 the Shuck Funeral Home was sold to Enos Renner, a partner of Renner Brothers
Livery and Stable business and a major supplier of rental horse-drawn hearses to the community.  The business
begun by Asbury Shuck and continued by Enos Renner exists today as Renner-Wikoff Chapel.

Examination of newspaper obituaries and the records of funeral directors indicate that a substantial number of Jewish
funerals and burials in the early 20th century conformed more to the fashions of the time than to Jewish tradition. 
Elaborate coffins and burial vaults became more common and there is little evidence that ritual preparation of the
dead was being done on a regular basis until the revival of a local Chevra Kadisha.

In the late 20th century the Champaign - Urbana Jewish community continued to explore the options provided by
modern funeral practice.  The Jewish cemetery contains many burials of cremated remains.  Cremation is a practice
permitted, with reluctance, by the Reform movement.  Another innovation is the provision of space set aside in a
mausoleum for entombment of those who choose that form of interment.  One of the  responsa (rabbinic judgments)
found on pages 163 - 164 in Walter Jacob’s book Contemporary American Reform Responsa (Central Conference
of American Rabbis, New York: 1987) is in response to a question raised by Sinai Temple’s Rabbi Isaac Neuman on
the propriety of use of a mausoleum for interments.  The judgment, dated December 1981, was that “There is nothing
in Reform Judaism which would preclude burial in a mausoleum.”  Though this option remains open, only thirteen
members of the Jewish community have chosen to use it so far.

In the early 1990s, a study group led by Lynn and Ira Wachtel under sponsorship of the Champaign - Urbana
Hadassah chapter led to organization of a new Chevra Kadisha that is now a part of the Champaign - Urbana Jewish
Federation.  In addition to organizing the new Chevra Kadisha, the study group made a major contribution to the
community in the form of a guidebook (Lynn Wachtel & Alice Berkson, A Guide to Death and Mourning
Traditions, Champaign - Urbana Jewish Federation, Champaign, IL, 1993, 2000 and 2015).  

With establishment of the new Chevra Kadisha, Jewish funerals began a noticeable move back toward the ideals of
simplicity in burial practice, even in cases where the services of the Chevra Kadisha itself were not used.  Funeral
homes in the community also became better acquainted with the range of Jewish funeral practices as a result of
cooperative interaction with the Chevra Kadisha.  Funeral directors provided working space for members of the
Chevra Kadisha to perform Tahara (ritual washing and dressing of the body) and opened their buildings to the
Shomrim (guardians) who watch over the deceased from the time of death to the time of burial.

The Champaign - Urbana Jewish Cemetery Today

Historically, the Champaign - Urbana Jewish Cemetery has been a community resource, created before any currently
existing Jewish organization and maintained through the years by members of all Jewish organizations in the
community.  Sinai Temple is now the legal owner of the cemetery land and the Jewish sections of Mount Hope are
currently managed by a committee appointed by the Board of Trustees of Sinai Temple.  However, it holds this land
in stewardship for the entire Jewish community. 

With the exception of the donations of the founding members of Ahavat Achim and the groups that maintained it
prior to implementation of endowed land care by the management of Mount Hope Cemetery, the cemetery has
always been self-supporting.  Income from sale of burial rights has been used solely to buy added space.  The price
of burial rights has been set at the minimum required to buy replacement land and provide free space for indigent
burials.  Since Sinai Temple first took over stewardship of the cemetery, its bylaws have dictated that the cemetery
funds be segregated from other Temple funds and accounted for separately.  
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Dedication.   This report is dedicated to the memory of all of those buried or entombed in the Jewish sections of Mount

Hope Cemetery.    To aid identification,  names of parents,  spouses,  and (where space was available) children appear in

the main listing of names.   Usually the individual matzevah (grave monument) was a primary source of information.  

Monument locations and inscriptions were carefully compared with Sinai Temple and Mount Hope Cemetery records (a

task hindered by the loss of most cemetery records in a fire at Sinai Temple in January 1971).   Relatives and friends

were then approached for added information on names,  dates,  and family relationships.   Finally,  use was made of

newspaper obituaries,  local histories,  biographies,  the Sinai Temple Yahrzeit list,  the Sinai Temple Memorial Plaques,

records of local funeral directors,  the Social Security Death Master Index and Champaign County Death Records.   All of

these sources are,  of course,  fallible,  and we frequently found conflicts between them.  If you find errors or know of

additional sources of information,  please let us know so the next edition of this report can be made more helpful.  
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Jewish Sections in Mount Hope

Mount Hope Cemetery is located at 611 East Pennsylvania Avenue in the city of Champaign.  The cemetery
straddles the boundary between the cities of Urbana and Champaign, though all Jewish sections are in the

Champaign portion.  Mount Hope is at the South end of the University of Illinois Campus, bounded on the North
by Pennsylvania Avenue and on the South by Florida Avenue.  The diagram on page 7 shows locations of the

Jewish sections in Mount Hope.  The East half of Block 24, the “Hebrew Congregation” block, is the oldest
Jewish section.  It is located near the North edge of Mount Hope, just West of the GAR section.  The Jewish

section of Block 24 was expanded from the original 21 lots to 33 lots containing 8 plots each, for a total of 264
plots.  An addition to the West edge of Block 24 providing  an additional 36 4-plot lots, for a total of 144 plots

was begun in 1995 and consecrated in the Fall of 2000. Work on another extension to the south of the West
extension that added another 96 plots was completed in 2008

Block 25, located immediately to the East of Block 24 and just inside the Pennsylvania Avenue entrance to Mount

Hope, was opened in the 1950s.  Block 25 has 378 plots grouped in lots of 3 or 6 plots each. 

In the 1970s, the Sanctuary of Shalom, the Jewish section of the Mausoleum with 36 vaults was opened.

By May 2015, the Jewish sections held a total of 408 burials and 13 entombments.

Plot Location Codes.   Mount Hope locations are represented by a 3-part code.  The first element of the code is
the Block number (24, 25, or the letter M if in the Mausoleum).  The second element of the code is the Lot

number (or,  in the Mausoleum, the level number).   The third element of the code is the Plot number (or,  in the
Mausoleum, the horizontal range number).   Thus, the code “25-TT-3" represents Plot 3 in Lot TT of Block 25,

and the code “M-3-A”  represents the vault at the “A” (left-most) end of level “3” (from the Mausoleum floor).

Locating an Individual.    For precise location of an individual,  use the alphabetized list of burials and
entombments at the end of this report.   That list contains the full name of each person, selected personal

information, and a plot location code.  Use the plot location code and the detailed maps beginning on page 4 to
find the desired block, lot,  and plot.   Where space on these detailed maps allows, the name, year of birth,  and

year of death is shown for each person.  Note the key on each map for interpretation of special symbols.  

Unmarked Burials.   Following some traditions, burial of a nefel (an infant who did not live at least 30 days),  is
not marked by a monument.   Also, the dominant North American Jewish custom is to wait until a year after death

before marking a burial with a monument.   Both temporarily and permanently unmarked burials are indicated on
the maps by names enclosed in dashes.  For example, the unmarked 1919 burial of the 3-year-old son of Moses

and Nettie Selicovitz who died in the influenza epidemic of the winter of 1918-1919 is shown as: 
 -LOUIS SELICOVITZ 1916-1919-

Multiple Burials.   Plots that contain multiple burials,  usually involving infants, are indicated on maps by names

enclosed by inequality symbols < like this> .  For example,  the plot that contains the marked 1935 burial of Rose
Hostetler (infant daughter of Walter and Lena Selicovitz Hostetler) is shared with the unmarked 1916 burial of

Elvira Irving.  This combination of shared and marked/unmarked burials is shown on the detailed map as: 
< R  HOSTETLER / - E  IRVING->

Because of space limitations on the maps, the above entry abbreviates the names and shows no dates.  Full names
and dates (where known) can be found listed in alphabetic order by surname on the pages that follow the maps.  

Lot and Plot Spacing and Size.   For clarity on the detailed maps, lots are shown as boxes containing the

individual burial plots.  These boxes are separated on the detailed maps by surrounding space to allow labeling of
lots.  With rare exceptions, adjacent lots in the cemetery are not actually separated by any space.   Individual

burial plots are 40 x 120 inches in Block 24 and Block 24 Extensions, and 48 x 120 inches in Block 25.
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PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE

KEY 24 - A 24 - 4 24 - 3 24 - 2 24 - 1

                          GRAVES IN BLOCK 24 MEASURE 40 in x 120 in

         N                LOCATIONS ARE SPECIFIED BY BLOCK-LOT-PLOT.

                           BLOCK-LOT IS SHOWN AT UPPER EDGE OF EACH

                           LOT BOX.  PLOT IS SHOWN AT LEFT EDGE OF 

                           LEFT-MOST BOX IN EACH ROW. 

EXAMPLE:  MIER RUBIN, BELOW, IS IN BLOCK 24, LOT 19, PLOT 4.  

                            -NO MONUMENT-   <MULTIPLE BURIAL IN PLOT>

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

HYMAN SIMON  1875-1936

<DORA SIMON/ SIMONSON>

SUSAN DEUTSCH  1943-1943

HATTIE KAHN  1870-1870

SOLOMON KAHN  -1871

SARAH SCHWARZ 1850-1893

EDNA GORE  1903-1912

JEANNETTE LEVY 1859-1918

FLORA LOEB  1902-1903

ANNA GROSSMAN 1870-1916

DAVID GROSSMAN  -1922

MORRIS GROSSMAN  -1961

BLANCHE LOEB  1881-1971

RACHEL LOEB  1879-1951

JOSIE LOEB  1873-1944

HARRY C LOEB  1874-1941

  LOEB FAMILY MONUMENT

  LOEB FAMILY MONUMENT

MATHILDE LOEB  1849-1927

ABRAHAM LOEB  1840-1909

CHARLES WOLFF  1867-1948

LIDA K WOLFF  1874-1957

RUDOLF  KUHN  1872-1946

  KUHN FAMILY MONUMENT

  KUHN FAMILY MONUMENT

LEOPOLD KUHN  1876-1947

LENA KUHN  1843-1906

JOSEPH KUHN 1835-1915

24 - 19 24 - 20 24 - B 24 - 21 24 - 22 24 - 23 24 - 24

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

<ALEX SELIGMAN/ -JUNG->

SARAH SELIGMAN  '83-1971

 

MIER RUBIN  1868-1938

HARRY BROWN  1901-1962

<-NEWMARK-/-MARCUS->

JOE WISEMAN  1876-1938

LOUIS BROWN  1908-1936

ROSA RIMSON  1886-1918

-YETTA BROWN    -1921-

SOLOMON BAYARD  '78-1920

MORRIS TUCKMAN  '92-1924

ROSE LEVINSON  1872-1944

MOSES LEVINSON  '58-1932

MARY A BROWN  1881- 1958

BENJAMIN BROWN  '74-1925

HEINRICH SCHWARZ  -1943

GRETE SCHWARZ  1888-1983

JOHN STERNBERG  '66-1944

MORRIS COFFMAN  '67-1945

BERTHA COFFMAN '82-1961

FLORA C LYONS  1869-1958

MORRIS S LYONS  '62-1918

ROSE A KUHN  1887-1968

ISAAC KUHN  1866-1956

CARLYN GOTTSCHALK  -2004

KURT GOTTSCHALK  1911-57

FISHER INFANT 1889-1889

WM. YOUNGERMAN 1907-75 HARRIET STERN  1918-1955

WALTER STERN, Jr  -1999

ETHEL STERN  1887-1959

WALTER STERN  1877-1942

ALPINER STERN  1902-1919

MEME A STERN  1874-1969

ALBERT STERN  1875-1969

STERN INFANT

  STERN FAMILY MONUMENT

NATHAN STERN  1836-1923

BABETTE STERN  1854-1932

ABRAHAM STERN  1838-1901

24 - 30 24 - 29 24 - C 24 - 28 24 - 27 24 - 26 24 - 25

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

TAMMY T SMITH  -1996

BEATRICE TEPPER  -2005

MANIE TEPPER  1903-1963

 TEPPER FAMILY MONUMENT

 TEPPER FAMILY MONUMENT

ANNA TEPPER  1880-1963

DAVID TEPPER  1877 -1952

ALBERT STERN  1915-1986

  STERN FAMILY MONUMENT

  STERN FAMILY MONUMENT

MARJORIE STERN 1917-1970

NORMA LEWIS   1919-2010

ARTHUR LEWIS 1915-2008

BERNICE LEWIS  1894-1961

LEONARD LEWIS  1884-1980

-MICHAEL LEWIS 1940-2014-

< -SELICOVITZ INFANTS- >

PHILIP ALSFELDER 1855-1928

 ALSFELDER FAMILY MON.

 ALSFELDER FAMILY MON.

AMANDA ALSFELDER -1906

<R HOSTETLER / -E IRVING->

<IDA DAVIS / ABIE DAVIS>

-LOUIS SELICOVITZ  -1919-

MOSES SELICOVITZ  '73-1949

NETTIE SELICOVITZ  '81-1946

BESSIE SELICOVITZ  '57-1927

-ABRAHAM SELICOVITZ 1928-

SIM & JOE COHEN 1887-1892

SOLOMON COHEN  -1913

BERTHA B COHEN  1863-1941

LOUIS L BING  1862-1923

SARA L BING  1868-1963

BENJAMIN BING  1867-1943

JONAS BING  1837-1913

EDWARD BING  1872-1899

BETTIE BING  1843-1899

24 - 43 24 - 44 24 - D 24 - 45 24 - 46 24 - 47 24 - 48

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

9

 LEAVITT FAM. MONUMENT

 LEAVITT FAM. MONUMENT

JEANETTE DAVIS  -1969

MOLLIE LEAVITT  1888-1959

ABE LEAVITT  1876-1936

<-BROWN- / EINHORN 1949>

SIMA SIMON  1896-1971

ABRAHAM SIMON  '88-1952

ANNA REICHMAN   '84-1947

HARRY REICHMAN  '74-1958

ALFRED REICHMAN  1911-85

JOSEPHINE KAUFMAN  -1991

STANLEY KAUFMAN  -1977

-JOAN SCHWARTZ 1927-2013-.  

  KAUFMAN FAMILY MON.

JACOB KAUFMAN  1865-1921

HATTIE KAUFMAN  -1962

E L FREUDENSTEIN  -1947

BERTHA FREUDENSTEIN 1924

MILLARD FREUDENSTEIN 

  FREUDENSTEIN FAMILY MON

  FREUDENSTEIN FAMILY MON

JOSEPH FREUDENSTEIN -1915 

LOUIS FREUDENSTEIN -1916

HANNAH FRUEDENSTEIN

 SCHILLER FAMILY MON.

 SCHILLER FAMILY MON.

ESTHER MEYER 1829-1914

BETTE SCHILLER 1849-1906

ROSE SCHILLER  1874-1906

MEYER MEYER 1793-1875

SELMA L. BROWN 1895-1929

BARBARA LOWENSTERN-1939

MONROE LOWENSTERN -1934

<LEVINSOHN,  LEVINSOHN>

HARRY  LEVINSOHN '81-1947

-JAMES W BURT 1858-1935--

JENNIE L BURT 1869 -1913

CAROLINE LOWENSTERN '15

MORRIS LOWENSTERN -1916

BETTE LOWENSTERN 1834-83

PHILIP LOWENSTERN 1804-71

24 - 54 24 - 53 24 - E 24 - 52 24 - 51 24 - 50 24 - 49

1

2

3

4

5

6

7

8

MILTON M MEIS  1875-1931

 MEIS FAMILY MONUMENT

 MEIS FAMILY MONUMENT

CLARA B MEIS 1888-1944

STEPHANIE WALDBAUER 

PHILIP E REICHMAN -2000

EDWARD TALLEY 1966-2005

FLO. WEINGARTEN -1965  SAM

WEINGARTEN -1934

REBECCA DAVIS  1882-1954

LOUIS DAVIS   1877-1944

HERMAN LEWIS  1889-1976

RACHEL LEWIS  1866-1955

WOLF LEWIS  1859-1942

CARRIE W ADLER  1861-1934

ADOLPH A ADLER  '61 -1935

AMELIA REINEBERG  '93-1963

LEE W REINEBERG   '91-1946

RACHEL LITMAN  1865-1948

SIMON LITMAN  1873-1973

CORINNE S KUHN  1877-1903

SOLOMON KORNBLUM -1874

FELIX KORNBLUM 1878-1879

BERTHA KORNBLUM '80-1882

DORA KORNBLUM '50-1899

JOSEPH KORNBLUM  -1924

SOLOMON COHEN  -1988

JULIUS B COHEN   1888-1973

SIDNEY N COHEN  1885-1932

  COHEN FAMILY MONUMENT

  COHEN FAMILY MONUMENT

  COHEN FAMILY MONUMENT

ADDIE B COHEN   1859-1943

NATHAN COHEN   1850-1924

JULIUS B BERNSTEIN -1890

FANNY W BERNSTEIN -1906

SOLOMON BERNSTEIN -1906

  BERNSTEIN FAMILY MON.

  BERNSTEIN FAMILY MON.

CHAMPAIGN IL   MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY  BLOCK 24  —  OLD HEBREW CONGREGATION SECTION
7 FEB 2014



PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE

PLOT BLOCK - LOT     BLOCK - LOT        BLOCK - LOT

 1

2

3

4

 

  

  

24 - A01          1

2

3

4

MICHAEL FAIMAN 1935-2004

ALLAN LEVY 1929-2010 

 

 

24 - B01             1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24 - C01

1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24- A02           1

2

3

4 JULIAN FRANKENBERG -2013

24 - B02             1

2

3

4

  

  

  

-BARBARA KLEIN 1936-2015  

24 - C02

1

        2

        3

        4

  

  

  

  

24 - A03          1

2

3

4

24 - B03             1

2

3

4

DONALD GINSBERG -2007

  

  

LESTER SELIGMAN -2004

24 - C03

 1

2

3

4

ANDREW  ISSERMAN  -2010

24 - A04          1

2

3

4

 

 

 

 LISA BUSJAHN 1955-2007

24 - B04             1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24 - C04

 1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24 - A05          1

2

3

4

 ABETTA HELMAN 1941-2007

 

 

 

24 - B05             1

2

3

4

  

  

  

24 - C05

 1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24 - A06          1

2

3

4

F MOVSHOVICH - 2003

 

 

 

24 - B06             1

2

3

4

  

  

RALPH NEWMAN -2010  

BEVERLY NEWMAN -2009

24 - C06

 1

2

3

4

  

  

  

MICHAEL TEPPER 1941-2007  

24 - A07          1

2

3

4

BORIS MIRENSKY -2002

POLYA GORELIK 1919-2012 

 

24 - B07             1

2

3

4

BORIS KATZ 1923-2005

  

  

SYLVIA BARON 1911 -2002

24 - C07

 1

2

3

4

  

  

  

  

24 - A08          1

2

3

4

 

 

 

 

24 - B08             1

2

3

4

  

-PHILIP RODKIN 1968-2014-

MORRIS BERG 1921-2004  

  

24 - C08

 1

2

3

4

  

  

  

DAVID SHORESMAN -2001

 24 - A09          1

2

3

4

 

 

 

 

24 - B09             1

2

3

4

  

  

OLGA GORODINSKI  -2007  

IAKOV GORODINSKI  -2001

24 - C09

1

2

3

4

SAMUEL GOLDBERG -2001

  

REBECCA SHAPIRO  1913-2002

MILTON SHAPIRO  1912-2003

24 - A10        1

2

3

4

 

 

 

 

24 - B10           1

2

3

4

  

DAVID WAISVISZ  1967-2004

MYRNA GOLDEN -2012 

HAROLD JACOBSON -2014

24 - C10

 1

2

3

4

  

LOUIE BLOCKMAN  1913-2002

REBECCA BLOCKMAN -2007

24 - A11        1

2

3

4

 

LEO WEISEL 1915-2003

-CAROL CHABOT 1952-2014- 

 

24 - B11           1

2

3

4

-ANNE WEISEL 1918-2015-  

  

-CAROL CHABOT 1952-2014  

  

24 - C11

 1

2

3

4

  

  

NITA APRILL 1921-2005  

JEROME APRILL 1919-2004

24 - A12        1

2

3

4

 

 

  

  

24 - B12           1

2

3

4

BLAIR KLING 1929-2011 

L. KOCHERGINSKAYA -2006

 R. KORCHAGINA -2009  

24 - C12

        N
CHAMPAIGN IL   MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY    WESTERN EXTENSION OF BLOCK 24

LOCATIONS ARE SPECIFIED BY BLOCK-LOT-PLOT.  EACH LOT IS MARKED BY A STONE AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF THE LOT.  
EACH LOT IN THIS SECTION CONTAINS  4 PLOTS WHICH EACH MEASURE 40 INCHES BY 120 INCHES.                                                     1 MAY 2015



LEBANON STREET

PLOT BLOCK - LOT        PLOT BLOCK - LOT  

 1
2
3
4

24 - A13               1
2
3
4

24 - B13      

1
2
3
4

24- A14                1
2
3
4

   24 - B14       
  

1
2
3
4

24 - A15               1
2
3
4

24 - B15      

 1
2
3
4

24 - A16               1
 2
3
4

24 - B16      

 1
2
3
4

24 - A17               1
2
3
4

24 - B17      

 1
2
3
4

 
 
 

24 - A18               1
2
3
4

24 - B18      

BLOCK 8     1

2
3
4

 WILLIAM GRAFF 1940-2011 24 - A19               1
2
3
4

24 - B19      BLOCK 23

 1
2
3
4

24 - A20               1
2
3
4

24 - B20      

 1
2
3
4

24 - A21               1
2
3
4

24 - B21      

 1
2
3
4

24 - A22               1
2
3
4

 

  

24 - B22      

 1
2
3
4

-EMILY PETERMAN 1977-2013- 24 - A23               1
2
3
4

24 - B23      

 1
2
3
4

24 - A24               1
2
3
4

24 - B24      

          N
CHAMPAIGN IL   MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY    SOUTH ADDITION TO BLOCK 24

LOCATIONS ARE SPECIFIED BY BLOCK-LOT-PLOT.  EACH LOT IS MARKED BY A STONE AT THE NORTHEAST CORNER OF THE LOT.  
EACH LOT IN THIS SECTION CONTAINS  4 PLOTS WHICH EACH MEASURE 40 INCHES BY 120 INCHES.                                      1 MAY 2015



PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE

25 - PP 25 - UU 25 - AAA 25 - JJJ 25 - KKK 25 - TTT 25 - UUU

1

2

3

ROSE MANDEL 1917-2010

ELI BENJAMIN MANDEL -1981

-SANDRA MOLASKY 1940-2014

J EISENSTEIN  1977-2001

L EISENSTEIN  1942-1985

CYNTHIA CHURCHILL -2001

25 - QQ 25 - VV 25 - BBB 25 - III 25 - LLL 25 - SSS 25 - VVV

1

2

3

4

5

6

HARRY HIRSHENSON  -1976 

MILDRED HIRSHENSON -1985

ELEANOR BLUM 1909-2011

FLORENCE BROWN CAPRI -79

MORRIS BROWN  1902-1983

MORRIS DAVIS  1933-1985

MARIANNE FERBER -2013

ROBERT FERBER  1922-1981

DOROTHY ALTMAN 1914-2009

STEVEN B DIAMOND  -1980

TALIA BENNA SEID  -1993

-TRACY J DLOTT -1994-

EDWARD DESSEN 1924-2005

PALTIEL BACH 1938-1998

- JUNE WOLBACH 1916-2005-

VIVIAN ADELSTON 1938-2012

WILLIAM ADELSTON - 2002

ALBERT RIGBERG 1910-2001

ROSE RIGBERG 1910-2000

25 - RR 25 - WW 25 - CCC 25 - HHH 25 - MMM 25 - RRR 25 - WWW

1

2

3

4

5

6

JEWEL KURLAND 1928-2013

AARON KURLAND 1927-2011

SADYE MARCO 1905-1999

JACOB MARCO  1905-1978

BERNICE WAX 1918-2006

NELSON WAX  1917-1992

DAVID W. WAX 1952-1978

JANE WALTER  1932-1987

ANNETTE L GLASER  -1991

MILTON R GLASER  -1985

FRANCES BLOOMFIELD -2004

DANIEL BLOOMFIELD -2005

HAROLD BERGER  1922-1989

JOSHUA GOTTHEIL  1969-89

ELKA EIDLICH 1903-1990

STEPHEN STORCH  1939-2000

NICOLE STORCH  1942-2005

LAURA DUBIN  1916-2001

RICHARD LEVIN  1939-1991

ADELE LIBMAN  1909-1994

CLARENCE LIBMAN  1904-83

25 - SS 25 - XX 25 - DDD 25 - GGG 25 - NNN 25 - QQQ 25 - XXX

1

2

3

4

5

6

LISA WEICHSEL  1963-1966 IVENS SIEGEL 1932-2014

NAOMI SIEGEL    1929-1999

ARTHUR MAYORWITZ -1988

H GENE SLOTTOW  -1989

REBECCA DODIN   -1990

RUTH GORDON  1913-2002

LOUIS GORDON   1913-1995

JACOB BEN-ABRAHAM -1992

MOLLY M. FRIEDMAN -1994

HAROLD GOLDBERG  -1999

-BRIAN SILVERMAN 1943-2011-

LIBBY GOLDBERG  1902-2000

PAULETTE DECKARD  -2004

25 - TT 25 - YY 25 - EEE 25 - FFF 25 - OOO 25 - PPP 25 - YYY

1

2

3

4

5

6

<ALAN & JANICE LIBMAN >

PHOEBE LIBMAN  1900-1966

BEN LIBMAN  1896-1971

IRVING WEISSMAN  1914-85

NORMA KLEIN   1907-1974

SOLOMON KLEIN  -1990

MYER ROSENFIELD 1922-98

< KUZNETSOV >

LEAH NORIAN   1893-1983 

ANNA RUTH STEIGMANN 2006

FREDERICK STEIGMANN1998

FREDERICK MCGAVRAN 2010

ADAM FEINBERG 1991-2002

S SUDMAN  1928-2000

JOSEPH HUELSING  1942-96

FLORENCE GOTTLIEB -2004

<SORKIN>

LUCILLE KOENIGSBERG -1996

VIOLA KOENIGSBERG -1995

KEY

          N               LOCATIONS ARE SPECIFIED BY BLOCK-LOT-PLOT.

BLOCK-LOT IS SHOWN AT UPPER EDGE OF EACH

LOT BOX.  PLOT IS SHOWN AT LEFT EDGE OF 

LEFT-MOST BOX IN EACH ROW.

-NO MONUMENT- <MULTIPLE BURIAL IN PLOT>

EXAMPLE:  PHOEBE LIBMAN  IS IN BLOCK 25, 

                            LOT TT, PLOT 3.  

THE EAST HALF OF BLOCK 25 IS BOUNDED ON THE NORTH BY

PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE, ON THE SOUTH BY THE GAR

(VETERANS) SECTION, ON THE EAST BY THE MAIN ENTRY ROAD

TO MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY,  AND ON THE WEST BY THE WEST

HALF OF BLOCK 25.    THE MOUNT HOPE OFFICE AND

MAUSOLEUM IS LOCATED ON THE EAST SIDE OF THE MAIN

ENTRY ROAD (DIRECTLY EAST OF BLOCK 25).

GRAVES IN BLOCK 25 MEASURE 48 INCHES BY 120 INCHES.

                MAUSOLEUM VAULTS (LOCATED IN BUILDING TO EAST OF BLOCK 25)

LILY FISHER 1915-1997                            ESTHER L HAYS  1912-1995           BERTHA TANNER  1916 - 2003

JACOB BEN HAMBURG   1898-1991        RUSSELL W HAYS  1914-1993       LEWIS TANNER 1915-1995

FLORENCE D HAMBURG  1905-1983      CHARLES F LOEB 1882-1963  

JOSEPH HAMBURG   1914-2009              HELEN W LOEB 1907-1995        

MERLE B HAMBURG 1919-2010               JEROME J SHOLEM 1895-1975    

                                                                     FAYE S SHOLEM 1900-1985     

  SEE THE SEPARATE TABULAR LIST OF NAMES IN ALPHABETIC ORDER FOR  DETAILS OF

  NAMES, DATES, AND INFORMATION FOUND ON MONUMENTS.

CHAMPAIGN IL    MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY    EAST HALF OF BLOCK 25
1 MAY 2015



PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE

25 - E 25 - F 25 - O 25 - P 25 - EE 25 - FF 25 - OO

1

2

3

MARIE SIMONSON  1905-83

HYMEN SIMONSON  1903-56

EVA M REZITS  1895-1967

I IRWIN REZITS  1894-1970 WERNER MARX  1923-1965

ESTHER C SELICOVITZ  -1986

ABE L SELICOVITZ  -1977

ORLIE GRISS  1968-1970

SUSAN M SIRKIS  1955-1968

JOHANNA BRAUNFELD  -1979

FRITZ L BRAUNFELD  -1971

EDITH W SCHWARTZ  -1973

JEAN D SCHOLL  1904-1975

25 - D 25 - G 25 - N 25 - R 25 - DD 25 - GG 25 - NN

1

2

3

4

5

6

JENNET REZITS  1897-1988

ALBERT REZITS  1898-1987

ISAAC MORHAIM 1922-2010

ROSALIE WILLIS 1945-1997

ADOLF ADLER  1872-1950

FRIEDERICKE WEISS  -1958

EDITH C GEFFERT  1902-1982

ALVIN D GEFFERT  1902-1970

BERTHA  WINDMULLER -1985

SOLOMON WINDMULLER  -54

ROSA LEE BRILL  1913-83

ISIDORE BRILL  1908-1956

IDA WERTHMAN  1894-1959

DEBRA R WEINGART 1970-71

ESTHER WOOLFSON  -1971

ALVIN HAMBURG 1910-1997

ALBERT B HALPER   -1974

LILLYUN V HALPER   - 1959

EDITH SAPOZNIK 1916-2000

HENRY SAPOZNIK 1912-1999

HENRY W GLASER 1904-1978

RAY BROOK LEVINE  -1984

RACHEL FRAENKEL  1902-84

GOTTFRIED FRAENKEL  -1984

-MILTON DERBER 1915-1997-

-ZELDA DERBER 1913-2002-

25 - C 25 - H 25 - M 25 - S 25 - CC 25 - HH 25 - MM

1

2

3

4

5

6

FAY TEPPER 1917-2005

MAX TEPPER  1905-1961

<H BROWN / A LEWIN>-

IDA B KLORFINE  1907-1992

MEYER KLORFINE  1899-1971

JEFFRY P KAUFMAN  1971-87

MIRIAM L APPLEBAUM  -1987

FANNIE KOHN  1907-1991

ALFRED KOHN  1905-1964

PEARL FELDMAN  1909-1986

SIDNEY FELDMAN  1907-1988

LENORE SIMON  1895-1984

ABRAHAM SIMON 1889-1964

25 - B 25 - I 25 - L 25 - T 25 - BB 25 - II 25 - LL

1

2

3

4

5

6

SAMUEL A LIBMAN  1902-66

JEAN LIBMAN DAVIS 1909-71

JULIUS X DAVIS  1906-1986

RICK ROMERO  1932-1998

MYRON KORRY  1922-1982

EDWIN M BANKS  1926-1985

LEONARD DAVIS 1929-1998

CECIL DAVIS  1911 - 2002

-ARLENE GOLDSTINE -2015

<L & M GREENMAN>

FANNIE A GREENMAN  -1967

ISAAC LEE GREENMAN  -1980

DOLORIS DWYER 1918-1997

JOHN DWYER  1921-1988

MILDRED BARNETT  1905-71

MANDEL BARNETT  1905-66

SHIRLEY Z GUNTHER  -2010 

FLORENCE Z DOOLEY   -1981

LOTTIE ZIBEL  1902-1975

LEON ZIBEL  1891-1963

HUGH MAUS  1912-2002

ZELDA MAUS  1912–2001

BOBBIE KULWIN  1922-1968

MYRON KULWIN 1921-2006

MARVIN STEINBERG  1922-90

25 - A 25 - J 25 - K 25 - U 25 - AA 25 - JJ 25 - KK

1

2

3

4

5

6

SONYA PEARLMAN ‘95-1972

JUDY LEVIN 1941-1997

EZRA LEVIN 1892-1981

DANIEL M SHMIKLER -1951

RAYMOND SHMIKLER -1983

-JOSEPH SHMIKLER  -1995-

ALICE R SHMIKLER  -1969

JENNIE SHMIKLER  -1973

SAMUEL SHMIKLER  -1953

RUTH BERKSON  1913-2003

DAVID R BERKSON  1907-74

BELLA ROGINSKY 1958-2012

THORA WINAKOR 1929-2011

ANNETTE W WINAKOR  -1955

ARTHUR H WINAKOR  -1981

BESS WINAKOR 1942-2007

SARRA PRIVINA 1924-2011

DOROTHY SILVERMAN  -1983

CHARLES SILVERMAN  -1991

BEVERLY CARON 1913-2005

MAX CARON  1911-1973

ROSE DUCOFF 1925 - 1998

HOWARD DUCOFF 1923-2012

CHRIS KANIS 1971-2013

LENA GARBER  1899-1988

SAMUEL GARBER  1891-1972

KEY

          N                LOCATIONS ARE SPECIFIED BY BLOCK-LOT-PLOT.

BLOCK-LOT IS SHOWN AT UPPER EDGE OF EACH

LOT BOX.  PLOT IS SHOWN AT LEFT EDGE OF 

LEFT-MOST BOX IN EACH ROW.

EXAMPLE: 

 EZRA LEVIN IS IN BLOCK 25, LOT A, PLOT 3.  

GRAVES IN BLOCK 25 MEASURE 48 INCHES BY 120 INCHES

THE WEST HALF OF BLOCK 25 IS BOUNDED ON THE NORTH BY PENNSYLVANIA AVENUE, ON THE

SOUTH BY THE GAR (VETERAN'S) SECTION, ON THE EAST BY THE EAST HALF OF BLOCK 25, AND ON

THE WEST BY A ROAD SEPARATING BLOCK 25 FROM BLOCK 24 (THE OLD HEBREW CONGREGATION

SECTION).

SEE THE SEPARATE TABULAR LISTING OF NAMES IN ALPHABETIC ORDER FOR DETAILS OF NAMES,

DATES, AND SELECTED INFORMATION FROM MONUMENTS.  -NAMES ENCLOSED BY DASHES HAVE NO

MONUMENTS-   

CHAMPAIGN IL   MOUNT HOPE CEMETERY   WEST HALF OF BLOCK 25
1 MAY 2015



Alphabetic Listing by Surname

The following list summarizes major details known about each person buried or entombed in the Jewish sections
of Mount Hope Cemetery.  Included are full names; dates of birth and death; plot number; significant information
from the monument (in quotation marks); names of close relatives; and other available details as space permits.

Plot Location Codes.   Locations within Mount Hope are represented by a 3-part code in the Plot column.  The
first element of the code is the Block number (24 or 25,  or,  if in the Mausoleum, the letter M).   The second
element of the code is the Lot number (or,  if in the Mausoleum, the level number).   The third element is the Plot
number (or,  if in the Mausoleum, the horizontal range number).   Plot locations can be found on the earlier
detailed maps.  

Notes and Comments.   The Notes column gives added information or identifies major sources of information
found for the person beyond that in Mount Hope records or on the monument.   Codes used in the Notes column
are:  

Code       Indicates

   C Biographical information from J. O. Cunningham' s 1905 History (see below for full citation)
   D Champaign County Death Records used to determine or verify information
   H Monument contains a Hebrew or Yiddish inscription with added information
   O Information taken from obituary in the Champaign Daily News,  the Champaign-Urbana Courier,

or the Champaign-Urbana News-Gazette
   P Information on name or date of death verified from memorial plaque at Sinai Temple
   R Biographical information from Asa Rubenstein' s 1982 History (see below for full citation)
   S Social Security Death Records used to determine or verify dates of birth and death 
   V Veteran.  Served in the armed forces during a war 
   x Grave was unmarked at time of this report.   The burial may have been less than a year old, 

or may have been for an infant who died before it was a month old.
   m The individual was disinterred after burial and moved to another city.

The second line of each entry is a Comment Line.   On this line,  the following abbreviations have been used:
B.  Born in (town or country)
Bd Buried (date of burial)
D.  Died in (town or country)
DO Daughter Of
FO Father Of
HO Husband Of
Md Married (date and/or place of marriage)
MO Mother Of
SO Son Of or Sister Of
WO Wife Of

Bibliographic Citation of References.
Cunningham, J.  O. (1905),  History of Champaign County (reprinted 1984 by the Champaign County
  Historical Archives).
Rubenstein, Asa (1982),  “Midwestern Jewish Commitment and Practical American Idealism: The Early History

of Sinai Temple, Champaign, Illinois”.  Journal of the Illinois State Historical Society.  Vol LXXV
No. 2/Summer 1982. 82-100.
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        Name                                                                                     B orn                        Died                       Plot                  Notes
  

Adelston, Vivian 27 Mar 1938 19 Jan 2012 25-SSS-3 O  
  DO Isadore & Bessie Wolensky, WO William Adelston, MO 3
Adelston, William 16 Jun 1931  9 May 2002 25-SSS-4 O  
  SO Florence Adler and Nathan Adelston, HO Vivian Wolenski
Adler, Adolf 23 Jun 1872 28 Aug 1950 25-N-1 O  
  B. Frankfurt aM Germany, HO Hilda Adler, FO Erwin Van Allen
Adler, Adolph A.    1861  2 Feb 1935 24-52-2 OP  
  HO Carrie Wiener, FO Rose A. Kuhn & Amelia A. Reineberg
Adler, Carrie Wiener 11 Jun 1861 15 Sep 1934 24-52-1 OP  
  WO Adolph A. Adler, MO Rose A. Kuhn & Amelia A. Reineberg
Alsfelder, Amanda Lowenstern 25 Apr 1867 20 Aug 1906 24-28-8 C  
  DO Morris & Caroline Jericho Lowenstern, WO Philip, MO Ford
Alsfelder, Philip 15 Dec 1855 17 Aug 1928 24-28-5 O  
  HO Amanda Lowenstern, FO Ford, D. Cincinatti OH
Altman, Dorothy Eva Rachliss 12 Jan 1914 16 Aug 2009 25-VV-5 O  
  DO Hannah Citron and Nathan Ascher Rachliss, MO Mark & Nancy
Applebaum, Miriam Lasker 14 Aug 1912 30 Jul 1987 25-CC-6 O  
  DO Greenspan, WO Lewis Lasker, Irving Appelbaum, MO Judy Kaufman
Aprill, Jerome A.  1 Oct 1919  3 Oct 2004 24-A12-4 O  
  SO Samuel & Ann Cohen Aprill, HO Nita Burack, FO Karen Stewart
Aprill, Nita B. 13 Mar 1921 13 Jun 2005 24-A12-3 O  
  DO Frima Novack & Harry Burack, MO Floyd and Karen
Bach, Paltiel 18 Dec 1938 28 Oct 1998 25-SSS-1 O  
  SO Alan & Gertrude Kenig Bach, HO Judith Sonneborn Bach, FO 2
Banks, Edwin Melvin 21 Mar 1926 24 Mar 1985 25-I-5 VPO  
  SO Louis David & Eleanor Johnson Banks, HO Hilda Markoff Banks
Barnett, Mandel  1 Jan 1905 14 Mar 1966 25-BB-6 O  
  SO Max & Rachel Goldsmith Barnett, HO Mildred Scholl, FO Norman
Barnett, Mildred 24 Nov 1905 12 Apr 1971 25-BB-5 O  
  DO James & Sara Scholl, WO Mandel, MO Norman
Baron, Sylvia 14 Feb 1911  9 Mar 2002 24-C07-4 O  
  DO Paul & Jenny Mayer Baron, WO Roger Roy, MO Dennis Baron
Bayard, Solomon   7 Dec 1879  4 Apr 1920 24-20-3 DHO  
  SO Haiman Bayard, HO Fanny, D. Chicago IL
Ben-Abraham, Jacob 16 Jul 1949 20 Jul 1992 25-GGG-4 O  
  SO Howard & Camille Severson Kindseth, HO Ruth Moe Ben-Abraham
Berg, Morris  9 Jun 1921 13 Oct 2004 24-C08-3 O  
  SO Nathan & Esther Liberman Berg, HO Brenda Fagin Lerner
Berger, Harold  1 Aug 1922 25 Sep 1989 25-HHH-3 O  
  SO Fred & Rae Greenberg Berger, HO Dorothy Brooks, FO 4 Children
Berkson, David Ralph 11 Apr 1907 24 May 1974 25-K-6 OP  
  SO William & Annie Oshinsky Berkson, HO Ruth Koller Berkson
Berkson, Ruth Koller  4 May 1913  8 Dec 2003 25-K-5 O  
  DO Armin & Katherine Schlesinger Koller, MO 4
Bernstein, Fanny Wertheimer    1836 14 May 1906 24-49-3 O  
  B. Bergzabern Ger. WO Solomon Bernstein, Md 1855, Cincinnati OH
Bernstein, Julius B.    1868 27 Jul 1890 24-49-1   
  SO Solomon & Fanny Wertheimer Bernstein
Bernstein, Solomon 11 Jan 1831 24 Jul 1906 24-49-5 O  
  B. Bergzabern, Germany, HO Fanny, Clothier in Urbana 1854-1875
Bing, Benjamin 27 Aug 1867 16 Jun 1943 24-25-3 OR  
  SO Jonas & Bettie Meyer Bing, U of ILL class of 1888
Bing, Bettie Meyer 15 Jul 1843 12 Jul 1899 24-25-7 O  
  Sister-in-law of Esther Meyer,  WO Jonas Bing, MO 7 Children
Bing, Edward 23 Apr 1872 29 Jul 1892 24-25-5   
  "Edward, their son"  SO Jonas and Bettie Meyer Bing.
Bing, Jonas 23 Apr 1837 26 Dec 1913 24-25-4 O  
  HO Bettie Meyer, FO Ben,Louis,Leon,Edward,Bertha,Hannah,Carrie
Bing, Louis L.  1 Apr 1862 21 Nov 1923 24-25-1 OP  
  SO Jonas & Bettie, HO Sarah L., FO Simon, Adelaide, Arline & Bee
Bing, Sarah L. 16 Oct 1868 11 Dec 1963 24-25-2 O  
  DO Simon & Bienschen Leucht Loeb, WO Louis L. Bing
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Blockman, Louie 20 Nov 1913  8 Nov 2002 24-A11-3 O  
  HO Rebecca Rubenstein Blockman, FO Arnold
Blockman, Rebecca Rubenstein 24 Sep 1919 18 Dec 2007 24-A11-4 O  
  WO Louie Blockman, MO Arnold
Bloomfield, Daniel Kermit 14 Dec 1926 12 Sep 2005 25-CCC-6 OV  
  SO Joseph & Henrietta Namen Bloomfield,  FO Louis, Ruth & Anne
Bloomfield, Frances Aub 13 Sep 1930  8 Feb 2004 25-CCC-5 O  
  DO Joseph & Elizabeth Cope Aub, WO Daniel, MO Louis, Ruth & Anne
Blum, Eleanor 18 Mar 1909  8 Jul 2011 25-QQ-3 O  
  DO Isaac & Jane Moses Blum
Braunfeld, Fritz L.  2 Mar 1892 18 Mar 1971 25-FF-3   
  SO Rudolf & Anna Novak Braunfeld, HO Johanna, FO Peter Braunfeld
Braunfeld, Johanna  5 Jun 1895  3 Jan 1979 25-FF-2 S  
  DO Richard & Matilde Rudolf Back, WO Fritz, MO Peter Braunfeld
Brieland, Donald 15 Jan 1924 30 Sep 2011 24-A01-1 O  
  SO Martin L. and Gene Pauline Medhus Brieland, HO Wynne Korr
Brill, Isidore (Irving) 21 Jul 1908 29 Apr 1956 25-R-4 VOP  
  SO Benjamin & Celia Rosen Brill, HO Rosa, FO Carol,Joan,Kathryn
Brill, Rosa Lee 16 Jun 1913 29 Nov 1983 25-R-3 OP  
  DO Hyman & Gittel Rose, WO Isidore, MO Carol, Joan, Kathryn
Brown, Benjamin 28 Apr 1874 20 Nov 1925 24-20-8 OH  
  HO Mary Ann Landsburg, FO 13
Brown, Harry  4 Apr 1901 21 Dec 1962 24-19-5 O  
  SO Benjamin & Mary Ann Landsberg Brown, HO Leah Hirsberg, FO 2
Brown, Helen L. 10 Sep 1905 10 Dec 1988 25-S-1 VO  
  "PFC US Army World War II"  DO Benjamin & Mary Ann L. Brown
Brown, Infant    Oct 1910 24-44-1e x  
  Child of Benjamin & Mary Brown, Bd 20 Oct 1910
Brown, Louis 15 May 1908  6 Dec 1936 24-19-8 OH  
  SO Benjamin & Mary Ann Landsberg Brown. Was a racecar driver.
Brown, Mary Ann 15 Dec 1881 13 Oct 1958 24-20-7 OH  
  nee Landsberg/Londsburg, WO Benjamin, Mother of 13
Brown, Morris  6 Nov 1902 27 Jul 1983 25-QQ-6 VO  
  SO Benjamin & Mary Ann L. Brown, HO Sara Costa, WW II Veteran
Brown, Selma Lowenstern    1895    Jan 1929 24-47-3   
  DO Monroe & Barbara Alsfelder Lowenstern.  Bd 11 Jan 1929
Brown, Yetta    Mar 1921 24-20-2w x  
  Infant.  Bd 24 Mar 1921, no monument or obituary found
Burt, James W. 18 Dec 1859 14 Jul 1935 24-48-3 Ox  
  SO Lucy A Wolf & Benjamin Burt , HO Jennie Lowenstern
Burt, Jennie Lowenstern 26 Dec 1869  5 Jul 1913 24-48-4 C  
  DO Morris & Caroline Lowenstern. WO James W. Burt, Md 5 Jun 1895
Busjahn, Lisa Ann 13 Nov 1955 25 Aug 2007 24-B04-4 O  
  DO George & Grace Schild Busjahn, SO Arden Brugger
Capri, Florence Brown 17 Jul 1911 26 Feb 1979 25-QQ-4 O  
  DO Benjamin & Mary Ann Landsberg Brown, WO Salvatore Capri
Caron, Beverly 29 Nov 1913  2 Aug 2005 25-AA-5 O  
  DO Benjamin & Mary Ann Landsberg Brown, WO Max Caron, MO 2
Caron, Max  3 Nov 1911 29 Jun 1973 25-AA-6 OPV  
  SO Jack & Sarah Caron, HO Beverly Brown Caron, FO Candace, Sheila
Chabot, Carol Lynn 26 Mar 1952  3 Jul 2014 24-B11-3 Ox  
  DO Milton & Alice Lieberman Sostrin, WO Ron Chabot, MO 3
Churchill, Cyntha Ann 31 May 1946  5 Apr 2001 25-TTT-2 O  
  DO Francis P. & Phyllis Hanes Churchill
Coffman, Bertha Lowy    1882 25 Oct 1961 24-B-5 O  
  DO Samuel & Louise Lowy, WO Morris L. Coffman
Coffman, Morris L. 12 Feb 1867 27 Jan 1945 24-B-4 O  
  SO Wolford Coffman, HO Bertha Lowy, FO 4
Cohen, Addie (Adelaide) Bernstein 17 Aug 1859 25 May 1943 24-50-7 P  
  DO Solomon & Fanny Bernstein (B. Urbana) WO of Nathan H. Cohen
Cohen, Bertha Bing 27 Feb 1863 20 Jun 1941 24-26-8 O  
  DO Jonas & Bettie Bing,  WO Solomon Cohen
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Cohen, Julius B. 23 Feb 1888 26 Nov 1973 24-50-2 VPOS  
  SO Nathan H. & Addie Bernstein Cohen, WW I Veteran
Cohen, Nathan H.  5 Feb 1850 28 Dec 1928 24-50-8 P  
  SO Simeon & Simcha Sebag Cohen. HO Addie Bernstein, Md 1880
Cohen, Sidney N. 26 Jun 1885 19 Apr 1932 24-50-3 VO  
  "Capt. Co M, 130 Inf"  SO Nathan & Addie, HO Myrtle Conkwright
Cohen, Simeon & Joseph 19 Nov 1887 16 Jan 1892 24-26-6   
  "Twin sons of Sol & Bertha Cohen, died Jan 16, 1892, aged 4Y 2M"
Cohen, Solomon 17 Aug 1857 26 Jun 1913 24-26-7 O  
  SO Simeon & Simcha Sebag Cohen, HO Bertha Bing, Arcola IL merch.
Cohen, Solomon B. 11 Jan 1891 29 Sep 1988 24-50-1 VP  
  SO Nathan H. & Addie Bernstein Cohen, WW I veteran
Dancoff, Sidney Michael 27 Sep 1913 15 Aug 1951 25-N-3   
  Removed to Los Angeles, Jul 1994, Monument still present
Davis, Abie D.  4 Aug 1908  4 Sep 1910 24-27-2   
  SO Louis & Rebecca Selicovitz Davis, Bd 26 Jan 1910, no obit.
Davis, Cecil Benjamin 30 Mar 1911  5 Aug 2002 25-L-4 O  
  SO Louis & Rebecca Selicovitz Davis,  HO Edythe
Davis, Ida 26 Oct 1914  7 Apr 1927 24-27-2 H  
  DO Louis & Rebecca Selicovitz Davis
Davis, Jean Pivovitz Libman 18 Apr 1909 16 Jul 1971 25-B-5 OP  
  DO Sam & Belle Miller Pivovitz, WO Samuel Libman, Julius Davis
Davis, Jeanette Leavitt 25 Nov 1906 10 Aug 1969 24-43-6 P  
  DO Abe & Mollie Towlen Leavitt, WO Julius X Davis
Davis, Julius X.  8 Aug 1906  5 Jul 1986 25-B-6 SP  
  SO Louis & Rebecca Selicovitz Davis,  HO (1) Jeanette & (2) Jean
Davis, Leonard Norman 19 Sep 1929  1 Dec 1998 25-L-3 VO  
  SO Julius X & Jeannette Leavitt Davis, USAF (Korea)
Davis, Louie 21 Dec 1877 10 Jan 1944 24-53-8 O  
  HO Rebecca Selicovitz Davis, FO Morris, Julius, Cecil, Herman
Davis, Morris  9 Oct 1933  5 Apr 1985 25-VV-2 OH  
  SO Hyman & Mary Goldstein Davis, HO Ruth Miller, FO 3
Davis, Rebecca Selicovitz 18 Apr 1882  6 May 1954 24-53-7 O  
  Sister of Nellie Selicovitz, WO Louie, MO 4
Deckard, Paulette 29 May 1941 22 Nov 2004 25-QQQ-5 O  
  DO Maurice & Sylvia Levin Silver, WO William Wiley Deckard, MO 4
Derber, Milton 19 Jun 1915 19 Feb 1997 25-NN-3 Ox  
  SO Harry & Sophie Kalman Derber, HO Zelda Trenner Derber, FO 2
Derber, Zelda Trenner  7 Oct 1913 30 May 2002 25-NN-4 Ox  
  WO Milton, MO Clara and Charles
Dessen, Edward H. 24 Feb 1924 8 May 2005 25-III-6 O  
  SO Morris & Frances Cohen Dessen, HO Loretta Katz, FO 3
Deutsch, Susan Jean 15 Aug 1943 14 Dec 1943 24-04-1 O  
  DO Johannes L. & Hedwig Deutsch of University of Illinois
Diamond, Steven Benjamin  4 Apr 1970 12 Nov 1980 25-VV-6   
  SO Harold & Nancy Diamond
Dlott, Tracy Joseph 30 Nov 1994  3 Dec 1994 25-BBB-2w Ox  
  SO Dana D. Dlott & Mariah C. Sweetser
Dodin, Rebecca 27 Sep 1905  7 Feb 1990 25-DDD-6 S  
  WO Solomon Dodin, MO Solomon & Lev Lokshin
Dooley, Florence Zibel 29 Jul 1921 18 Dec 1981 25-II-2 O  
  DO Leon & Lottie Hamburg Zibel
Dubin, Laura 17 Mar 1916  9 Feb 2001 25-MMM-4 O  
  DO Morris & Dora Glasser Levine, MO Nicole Dubin Storch
Ducoff, Howard S.  5 May 1923 28 Aug 2012 25-JJ-2 O  
  SO Dave & Tillie Machinist Ducoff, HO Rose Hirsch, FO 3
Ducoff, Rose Hirsch  6 Mar 1925  8 Aug 1998 25-JJ-1 O  
  DO Jacob & Katie Weisner Hirsch, WO Howard Ducoff, MO 4
Dwyer, Doloris Greenman 24 Jun 1918  6 Jan 1997 25-T-5 O  
  DO Isaac & Fannie Appelbaum Greenman, MO Arlene & Sylvia
Dwyer, John J. 21 Oct 1921 30 Oct 1988 25-T-6 O  
  SO John & Gladys Pitts Dwyer, HO Doloris Greenman Dwyer
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Eidlich, Elka 16 Apr 1903 17 Oct 1990 25-MMM-1 O  
  Mother of Leah Faiman.  Elka's husband died in 1978,
Einhorn, Carol Edith 30 Jul 1949  1 Aug 1949 24-44-1 O  
  DO Milton & Ann Einhorn, Niece of Selma Goldstein
Eisenstein, Joshua M.  3 Jul 1977 12 Feb 2001 25-UU-2 O  
  SO Bob and Laura Rosenthal Eisenstein
Eisenstein, Laura Rosenthal  9 Nov 1943 14 Aug 1985 25-UU-3 OH  
  DO Gabriel & Sylvia Held Rosenthal, WO Bob Eisenstein
Faiman, Michael 27 Mar 1935 15 Apr 2004 24-B01-1 O  
  SO Della Goldblum & Sydney Faiman, HO Lia Eidlic, FO 2
Feinberg, Adam 10 May 1991 28 Feb 2002 25-FFF-4 O  
  SO Samuel & Ellen Hochberg Feinberg.
Feldman, Pearl Tepper  6 May 1909 15 Oct 1986 25-HH-5 P  
  DO Anna & David Tepper.  WO Sidney S. Feldman,  MO Lee and David
Feldman, Sidney S.  3 Apr 1907 19 Mar 1988 25-HH-6 OP  
  SO Isaac & Ester Schetlis Feldman, HO Pearl Tepper Feldman, FO 2
Ferber, Marianne A. 30 Jan 1923 11 May 2013 25-VV-3 O  
  WO Robert Ferber, MO Don and Ellen
Ferber, Robert 13 Feb 1922  8 Sep 1981 25-VV-4 O  
  SO Samuel & Dinah Rosenthal Ferber, HO Marianne Abeles Ferber
Fisher, (Infant girl)  5 Nov 1889  5 Nov 1889 24-22-1 O  
  DO Emanuel & Clara Bernstein Fisher of Homer IL
Fisher, Lillian Silk 10 Dec 1915 25 Nov 1997 M-5-F   
  DO Samuel & Evelyn Meirz Silk, WO Grant Fisher (d. 1986)
Fraenkel, Gottfried S. 23 Apr 1901 26 Oct 1984 25-NN-2 OHS  
  SO Emil & Flora Weil Fraenkel (B. Munich), HO Rachel Sobel
Fraenkel, Rachel Sobel 28 Nov 1902 15 Jun 1984 25-NN-1 OHS  
  DO Moshe & Esther Licht Sobel (B. Lith.), WO Gottfried Fraenkel
Frankenberg, Julian 18 Jan 1938 13 Jan 2013 24-B02-4 O  
  SO Lester & Bess Adler Frankenberg, HO Natalie Kushner Frankenberg
Fraser, Tillie 21 May 1919 24 Aug 2006 24-C05-1   
  DO Louis & Elsie Krantz Solowey, AO Sara Kovar
Freudenstein, 

Joseph 27 Feb 1827  4 Sep 1915 24-45-6 OP  
  "Uncle Joe", Brother of Louis, Unmarried.  Clinton IL merchant
Freudenstein, Bertha (Ida)  3 May 1874 19 Sep 1924 24-45-2 OP  
  WO Edwin L. Freudenstein, Lived in Clinton IL
Freudenstein, Edwin L.  5 Sep 1869 31 Aug 1947 24-45-1 P  
  SO Louis & Hannah Freudenstein, HO Bertha
Freudenstein, Hannah  1 Aug 1848 23 Feb 1910 24-45-8 P  
  "Mamma"  WO Louis, MO Edwin L. and Hattie (Mrs Jacob M. Kaufman)
Freudenstein, Louis 16 Feb 1838 27 Jun 1916 24-45-7 OP  
  "Papa", HO Hannah, FO Edwin L. and Hattie (Mrs Jacob M. Kaufman)
Freudenstein, Millard  5 Oct 1908 25 Jun 1916 24-45-3 OP  
  SO Edwin & Bertha Freudenstein, D. Decatur IL car accident
Friedman, Molly Marie 18 Oct 1981 22 Nov 1994 25-NNN-1 O  
  DO Paul Alan Friedman & Mary L. Seidel Friedman
Garber, Lena  8 May 1899  9 Feb 1988 25-JJ-5 OP  
  DO Joseph & Goldie Koval Phillips, WO Samuel, MO Merle Hamburg
Garber, Samuel 25 Dec 1891 12 Feb 1972 25-JJ-6 OP  
  SO David & Dorothy Garber, HO Lena Phillips, FO Merle G. Hamburg
Geffert, Alvin D.  3 Oct 1902 19 Jun 1970 25-N-6 VSO  
  SO Charles & Rachel Lipschutz Geffert, HO Edith Crackow, WW II
Geffert, Edith Crackow 15 Dec 1902 31 Jul 1982 25-N-5 OS  
  DO Louis & Rose Holz Crackow, WO Alvin D. Geffert, MO 2
Ginsberg, Abraham Gerald 5 Feb 1916 5 May 2007 24-C05-3 O  
  HO Jean Eva Green, FO Gwen, Kay, Penny & Carol
Ginsberg, Donald M. 19 Nov 1933 7 May 2007 24-C03-1 O  
  HO Joli, FO Mark and Dana
Ginsberg, Jean Eva 12 Dec 1920 23 Dec 2006 24-C05-2 O  
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  WO Abraham, MO Gwen, Kay, Penny & Carol
Glaser, Annette Lewis 16 Mar 1928 20 Mar 1991 25-CCC-3 OP  
  DO Leo & Sara Litowich Lewis, WO Milton Glaser, MO 3
Glaser, Henry W.  4 Mar 1908  1 Jan 1978 25-GG-5 OS  
  SO Adolph & Ana Hauser Glaser, HO Minna Fritzland (died 1962)
Glaser, Milton R. 21 Feb 1923  4 Nov 1985 25-CCC-4 VP  
  SO Becky & Louis Nathan Glaser, HO Annette Lewis, FO 3
Goldberg, Harold  1 Apr 1909 16 Jan 1999 25-NNN-4 O  
  SO Abraham & Fannie Steinberg Goldberg, UO Janie Gordon Yairi
Goldberg, Libby 31 Mar 1902 21 Nov 2000 25-QQQ-4 O  
  DO Abraham & Fannie Steinberg Goldberg, AO Janie Gordon Yairi
Goldberg, Samuel Isaac 15 Aug 1923 22 Mar 2001 24-A10-1 OV  
  SO Jacob L. & Rachel Berkovitz Goldberg, HO Sheila, WWII
Golden, Myrna A. 19 Jan 1937 15 Oct 2012 24-C10-3 O  
  DO Abraham & Sylvia (Dryer) Jacobson, WO William Golden
Goldstein, Samuel 26 Mar 1886  3 Jul 1952 Om  
  SO Jacob & Libbie Goldstein, removed to St Louis MO
Goldstine, Arlene Schoenburg 23 Oct 1939 26 Mar 2015 25-T-1 Ox  
  DO Edward & Doloris Greenman Schoenburg, died in Knoxville TN
Gordon, Louis F. 26 Jan 1913 24 Aug 1995 25-GGG-3 VO  
  SO Abraham & Fannie Goldberg, FO Janie Gordon Yairi, WW II USA
Gordon, Ruth Jacobs 22 Aug 1913  7 Nov 2002 25-GGG-2 O  
  DO Joseph & Minnie Kapner Jacobs, WO Louis, MO Janie Yairi
Gore, Edna 14 Sep 1903  6 Oct 1912 24-04-7 O  
  "Rest in Heaven", B. Russia,  DO Jacob Gore, In U.S. 1 yr 4 mo
Gorelik, Polya 20 Oct 1919  1 Oct 2012 24-B07-2 O  
  DO Malka & Zelik Henkien, WO Naum Gorelik (d. 1941), Boris Mirensky 
Gorodinski, Iakov 29 Dec 1911 18 Dec 2001 24-C09-4 OV  
  SO Lev & Hanna Gorodinski, HO Olga Terekhnia, FO 3, WWII
Gorodinski, Olga 12 Jul 1923 1 Sep 2007 24-C09-3 O  
  DO Mikhael Terekhna, WO Iakov Gorodinski, MO 3
Gottheil, Joshua 14 Jul 1969  4 Apr 1989 25-HHH-6 H  
  SO Fred & Diane Gottheil, Grandson of Morris Gottheil
Gottlieb, Florence 11 Jan 1916 13 Jan 2004 25-PPP-1 O  
  DO Irving & Goldie Goldenbach Kornberg, WO William, MO Alma
Gottschalk, Carlyn 11 Aug 1915 30 Jul 2004 24-21-7 P  
  DO Lee & Amelia Adler Reineberg, WO Kurt Gottschalk, MO Paula
Gottschalk, Kurt 25 Feb 1911 26 Oct 1953 24-21-8 P  
  SO Albert & Paula Gottschalk, HO Carlyn Reineberg Gottschalk
Graff, William Arthur  1 Jan 1940  6 May 2011 24-A19-1 O  
  SO Morris & Eleanor Meierowitz Graff, HO Lorna Klorfine Graff, FO 3
Greenman, Beverly Dee 27 Nov 1938 8 Mar 2006 25-T-2   
  WO Myron Greenman,  Held PhD from UCSC
Greenman, Fannie Appelbaum 15 Jul 1900 20 Jun 1967 25-T-3 O  
  DO Bernard & Mollie Appelbaum, WO Isaac Lee Greenman 3 Aug 1917
Greenman, Isaac Lee 14 Dec 1896  1 Aug 1980 25-T-4 O  
  SO Morris & Rebecca Greenman, HO Fannie A., Lillie A.
Greenman, Leonard 22 Oct 1919  7 May 1993 25-T-2 V  
  "1ST SGT US Marine Corps World War II"  SO Isaac Lee & Fannie
Greenman, Myron 19 May 1931 16 Jun 2000 25-T-2 V  
  SO Isaac Lee & Fannie Appelbaum Greenman, U.S. Army (Korea)
Griss, Orlie 25 Sep 1968 23 May 1970 25-EE-2 OH  
  Child of Martin & Phina Shchori Griss
Grossman, Anna Weisberger 15 Jun 1870 12 Jul 1916 24-03-5 D  
  WO David Grossman, MO Morris,Samuel,Sadie,Ida,Esther Bd 15 Jul
Grossman, David 19 Mar 1872  3 Jan 1922 24-03-6 D  
  HO Anna, FO Morris,Sam,Fannie,Sadie,Ida,Esther, Bd 4 Jan 1922
Grossman, Morris 20 Jan 1903  1 May 1961 24-03-7 VO  
  SO David & Anna Weisberger Grossman, HO Mae Hall, WW II veteran
Gunther, Shirley Zibel 1926 2 Oct 2009 25-II-1 O  
  DO Leon & Lottie Hamburg Zibel, SO Milton and Florence
Halper, Albert B. 13 Sep 1895 16 Apr 1974 25-GG-1 OS  
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  SO Simon & Dora Halper, HO Lillyun Mallen, FO Donald, Sonya
Halper, Lillyun Violet 15 Nov 1895 21 Nov 1959 25-GG-2 OD  
  DO Wm. & Rebecca Mallen, WO Albert, MO Donald Gene, Sonya Singer
Hamburg, Alvin  1 Jun 1910 19 Apr 1997 25-DD-4 VO  
  SO Rubin & Dvorah Zarachovsky Hamburg, HO Mira Mashkes Hamburg
Hamburg, Florence D.  1 May 1905 12 Feb 1983 M-2-B OP  
  DO Joseph Aronson, WO Jacob Benjamin Hamburg,  MO Joyce, Reatha
Hamburg, Jacob Benjamin (Ben) 17 Dec 1898 15 Dec 1991 M-2-A OP  
  SO Rubin & Dvorah Leah Hamburg, HO Florence Aronson, FO 2
Hamburg, Joseph 25 May 1914  4 Jul 2009 M-1-A OV  
  SO Rubin & Dvorah Leah Hamburg, HO Merle, FO Stephan
Hamburg, Merle B.  6 Mar 1919  6 Oct 2010 M-1-B O  
  DO Samuel and Lena Garber, WO Joseph, MO Stephen
Hays, Esther Lynn  5 Mar 1912 30 Oct 1995 M-3-B O  
  DO Elmer & Libbey Bradford Cohen, WO Russell, MO Craig, Jeffrey
Hays, Russell W.  8 Nov 1914 14 Sep 1993 M-3-A VO  
  SO Emmerson & Minnie Withers Hays, HO Esther Cohen FO 2  WW II
Helman, Abetta Lee 22 Nov 1941 10 Feb 2007 24-B05-1 O  
  DO Sarah & Gordon Savran, WO Sandy, MO David & Deborah
Hirshenson, Harry  9 Mar 1903 25 Mar 1976 25-QQ-1 OPS  
  SO Abraham & Rebecca Cohen Hirshenson, HO Mildred Schulman
Hirshenson, Mildred Schulman  2 Jan 1918 18 May 1985 25-QQ-2 OPS  
  DO Rubin & Sophie Abramovitz Schulman, WO Harry Hirshenson
Hostetler, Rose 17 Jul 1935 24-27-1   
  DO Walter E. & Lena Selicovitz Hostetler
Huelsing, Joseph H. 12 Sep 1942  3 Oct 1996 25-OOO-3 O  
  HO Susan Hamburg, FO Nathaniel Aaron & Zachary Dillon Huelsing
Irving, Elvira 29 Jul 1916 14 Oct 1916 24-27-1 Ox  
  Buried NE corner 20 Oct 1916
Isserman, Andrew Mark 28 Jun 1947 4 Nov 2010 24-A04-2 O  
  SO Ellen & Manfred Isserman, HO Ellen Jacobsen, FO Jacob, Noah
Jacobson, Harold  1 Jun 1928  7 Feb 2014 24-C10-4 O  
  SO Abraham & Sylvia (Dryer) Jacobson
Jung, (Infant) 12 Dec 1925 12 Dec 1925 24-19-1 x  
  Buried NE corner of plot,  Stillborn child of Moses & Rivka Jung
Kahn, Hattie  7 Jun 1870  1 Aug 1870 24-04-2   
  "Dau. of Nathan & Hanna Kahn, D. Aug 1, 1870, aged 1 M & 25 D"
Kahn, Solomon   Abt 1836  6 Sep 1871 24-04-4 H  
  "In Memory of Solomon Kahn, Died Sep 6, 1871, Aged 35 Yrs"
Kanis, Christopher 15 Dec 1971 21 Mar 2013 25-JJ-4 O  
  HO Laura Steigmann Kanis
Katz, Boris Isaac 13 Sep 1923 10 Feb 2005 24-C07-1 O  
  HO Lilian G. Gonshaw, FO Daniel, Stephen & Miriam (Millikin)
Kaufman, Hattie 
aFreudenstein 16 Sep 1872 11 Jan 1962 24-D-8 OP  
  DO Louis & Hannah Freudenstein, WO Jacob M. Kaufman, MO Stanley
Kaufman, Jacob McClellan 19 Jul 1865 10 Feb 1921 24-D-7 OPC  
  SO Simon & Fannie Ottenheimer Kaufman.  HO Hattie Freudenstein
Kaufman, Jeffry Paul 12 Nov 1971 10 Oct 1987 25-CC-5   
  SO Jerome & Judith E. Lasker Kaufman
Kaufman, Josephine Hart 19 May 1904 18 Oct 1991 24-D-3 OS  
  DO Joseph & Rose Hart, WO Stanley L. Kaufman, MO Joan Schwarz
Kaufman, Stanley Louis 18 Jun 1900 22 Jul 1977 24-D-4 SP  
  SO Jacob & Hattie Kaufman, HO Josephine Hart, FO Joan K. Schwarz
Klein, Barbara 30 Dec 1936 17 Feb 2015 24-C02-4 Ox  
  DO Herman and Edith Pincus, WO Miles Klein, MO Cynthia and Gail
Klein, Norma  5 Aug 1907  9 Dec 1974 25-EEE-1 S  
  DO Joseph & Agnes Cohen Cohen, MO Elizabeth Klein Shapiro
Klein, Solomon A. 16 Jan 1908  8 Aug 1990 25-EEE-2 S  
  SO Hersh & Esther Schwartz Klein, FO Elizabeth Klein Shapiro
Kling, Blair Bernard 17 Apr 1929 2 May 2011 24-C12-1 OV  
  SO Eli and Lotta Kling, HO Julia Norian, FO Joanna and William
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Klorfine, Ida Borowsky  4 Feb 1907 22 Aug 1992 25-S-2 OSP  
  DO Nathan & Libby Raphael Borowsky, WO Meyer Klorfine, MO Lorna
Klorfine, Meyer 17 Mar 1899  7 Nov 1971 25-S-3 OSP  
  SO Max & Brina Swerinsky Klorfine, HO Ida Borowsky, FO Lorna
Kocherginskaya, Lidiya  6 Apr 1927  1 Jun 2006 24-C12-3 O  
  MO Nikolai Kocherginsky
Koenigsberg, Lucille  1 Oct 1909 30 May 1996 25-PPP-3 O  
  DO Samuel & Susan Bronstein Koenigsberg.  SO Florence Weinberg.
Koenigsberg, Viola  6 Nov 1901  9 Jan 1995 25-PPP-4 VO  
  DO Samuel & Susan Bronstein Koenigsberg.  Veteran of WW II (WAC)
Kohn, Alfred 30 Aug 1905 28 Apr 1964 25-HH-2 VPO  
  SO Herman Kohn, HO Fannie Tepper Kohn, WWII veteran, FO 2
Kohn, Fannie Tepper  9 Sep 1907 26 Aug 1991 25-HH-1 S  
  DO David & Anna Tepper, WO Alfred, MO Perry and Nate
Korchagina, Revekka 12 Dec 1922 28 Jul 2009 24-C12-4 O  
  DO Clara Schwartzburd & Isaac Ratner, WO Alexey, MO Svetlana
Kornblum, Bertha 26 Jan 1880 26 May 1882 24-51-6   
  "Dau. of Joseph & Dora Kornblum, Died 26 May 1882, Age 2Y 4M"
Kornblum, Dora    1850        1899 24-51-7   
  WO Joseph, MO Solomon, Felix, Bertha, Isadore and Guy Kornblum
Kornblum, Felix 28 Nov 1878 18 Jul 1879 24-51-5   
  "Son of Joseph & Dora Kornblum, Died 18 Jul 1879, age 7M 20D"
Kornblum, Joseph    1847    May 1924 24-51-8 O  
  Bd 15 May 1924. HO Dora, Tuscola IL merchant 1871-1904
Kornblum, Solomon 26 Feb 1872 26 Jan 1874 24-51-4   
  "Son of Joseph & Dora Kornblum, Died 26 Jan 1874, age 1Y 11M 8D"
Korry, Myron 23 Sep 1922 26 Oct 1982 25-I-4 P  
  SO Miriam & Peter Korogodsky, HO Vera Korry
Kuhn, Corinne Sturm 26 Jul 1877 13 Nov 1903 24-52-8 O  
  DO Gabriel Sturm, WO Isaac, MO Florence Meyer & Carolyn Feffer
Kuhn, Isaac 11 Sep 1866 21 Jan 1956 24-21-4 P  
  SO Joseph & Lena Loeb Kuhn, HO Corinne Sturm & Rose Adler
Kuhn, Joseph 19 Apr 1835  2 Jan 1915 24-01-8 VPC  
  SO Isaac & Sarah Schriesheim Kuhn,  HO Lena Loeb Kuhn
Kuhn, Lena Loeb    1843  8 Apr 1906 24-01-7 CP  
  DO Raphael & Rose Loeb, WO Joseph Kuhn (Md 1865), MO 7 children
Kuhn, Leopold 24 May 1878  3 May 1947 24-01-6 C  
  SO Joseph & Lena Loeb Kuhn.  Did not marry.
Kuhn, Rose Adler 19 Nov 1887 14 Feb 1968 24-21-3 RP  
  DO Adolph & Carrie W. Adler. 2nd WO Isaac, MO Ruth & Helen
Kuhn, Rudolph  2 Dec 1872 27 Apr 1948 24-01-3   
  SO Joseph & Lena Loeb Kuhn.  HO Rita Adler.  Bd 9 May 1948
Kulwin, Bobbie Rudolph 26 Nov 1922 25 Dec 1968 25-LL-1 OP  
  DO Louis & Ida Marie Steinberg Rudolph, WO Dr Myron Kulwin, MO 4
Kulwin, Myron 22 Apr 1921 22 Sep 2006 25-LL-2   
  HO Bobbie Rudolph Kulwin, SO Charles & Celia Berman Kulwin, FO 4
Kurland, Aaron 21 Feb 1927 8 Apr 2011 25-RR-4 OV  
  SO Jacob & Fanny Kurland, HO Jewel Marco, FO Ted, Steve, Marcy 
Kurland, Jewel Marilyn 9 Jun 1928 19 Dec 2013 25-RR-3 O  
  DO Jacob & Sadye Zimmerman Marco, WO Aaron, MO 3
Kuznetsov, Boris David 26 Aug 1977 21 Jan 1982 25-EEE-5   
  SO Edward & Helen Ilfirovich Kuznetsov
Kuznetsov, Nathan H.  1 Apr 1909 15 Feb 1992 25-EEE-5 V  
  SO Haim & Haya Kuznetsov, HO Rosa(Rachel), FO Edward,Boris,Sonya
Kuznetsov, Rosa bat David 12 Aug 1909 23 Feb 1993 25-EEE-5   
  Rachel, DO David & Sara Braginskaya Katsnelson, WO Nathan
Leavitt, Abe 10 Jul 1876 14 Sep 1936 24-43-8 P  
  SO Jacob & Lena Sachs Leavitt, HO Mollie, FO Jeanette & Arnold
Leavitt, Mollie Towlen 27 Oct 1888  9 Mar 1959 24-43-7 P  
  DO Joseph & Rachel Towlen,  WO Abe,  MO Jeanette and Arnold
Levin, Ezra 19 Aug 1892  1 Sep 1981 25-A-3 OP  
  SO Henry & Minnie Levin, HO Helen Pearlman Levin, FO 5
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Levin, Judy 26 Jun 1941 11 Jun 1997 25-A-2 PO  
  DO Ezra and Helen Levin
Levin, Richard Yair 30 Jun 1939 21 Jun 1991 25-MMM-6 O  
  SO Aron & Sarah Moshatvky Levin, Brother of Hannah Jaher
Levine, Ray Brook  8 Apr 1896 28 Jun 1984 25-GG-6   
  DO Hyman & Elsie Brook, WO Abe Levine, MO Elsa Dunn
Levinsohn, (infant boy) 28 Feb 1909  4 Mar 1909 24-48-1 O  
  SO Harry & Belle Lowenstern Levinsohn.
Levinsohn, Belle Lowenstern  1 Dec 1872 13 Mar 1957 24-48-1 OCR  
  DO Morris & Caroline Lowenstern, WO Harry M.  MO Caroline Lasky
Levinsohn, Harry M. 1881 13 May 1947 24-48-2 O  
  SO Jacob & Betty Levinsohn, HO Belle Lowenstern
Levinson, Moses H. 26 Dec 1858  5 Apr 1932 24-20-6 O  
  "Father"  HO Rose, FO Noah,Annie,Edith,Ida, Lived in Paxton IL
Levinson, Rose    1872 17 Jan 1944 24-20-5 O  
  WO Moses, MO Edith,Ida,Mrs Sam. Neiburg, Lived in Paxton, Elliot
Levy, Allan Henry 02 Nov 1929 29 Sep 2010 24-B01-2 O  
  SO David & Frances Levy, HO Merle Lefkowitz Levy, FO Ruth, Michael
Levy, Jeannette Cohen    1859  1 Jan 1918 24-04-8 O  
  WO Nissim Isaac (David) Levy, MO Lenore L. Simon & 5 more
Lewin, Allen 10 Dec 1924 17 Feb 2002 25-S-1 OV  
  SO Jerome Lewin & Helen Brown  US Army WWII
Lewis, Arthur  3 Jun 1915  6 Mar 2008 24-C-3 O  
  SO Leonard & Bernice Leiberman Lewis, HO Norma Ginsburg, FO 4
Lewis, Bernice Leiberman  1 Oct 1894 24 Nov 1961 24-C-4 RP  
  DO Mose & Alta Leiberman. WO Leonard, MO Arthur
Lewis, Herman  6 Feb 1889  4 Feb 1976 24-E-3 P  
  SO Wolf & Rachel Reuler Lewis (2nd wife) Half-Brother of Leonard
Lewis, Leonard 14 Jan 1884 10 Apr 1980 24-C-5 P  
  SO Wolf & Lena Reuler Lewis (1st wife), HO Bernice, FO Arthur
Lewis, Michael Myron 30 Oct 1940 26 Jan 2014 24-C-6 Ox  
  SO Arthur and Norma Lewis, HO Marsha Rodner, FO Julie, Rich, Amy
Lewis, Norma 23 Oct 1919 20 Feb 2010 24-C-2 O  
  DO Isadore & Bertha Ginsburg, WO Arthur Lewis, MO 4
Lewis, Rachel Reuler 17 Oct 1866 26 May 1955 24-E-4 OP  
  DO Louis & Henrietta Reuler. 2nd WO Wolf (Sister Lena was 1st)
Lewis, Wolf 15 May 1859  2 Apr 1942 24-E-5 OP  
  HO (1)Lena & (2)Rachel Reuler, FO (1)Leonard (2) Herman & Roy
Libman, Adele Goldman 16 Jan 1909  8 Jun 1994 25-WWW-2 O  
  DO Eliezer & Clara Reinhart Goldman, WO Clarence
Libman, Alan Louis 11 Feb 1929 24 Jan 2010 25-TT-2 O  
  SO Benjamin & Phoebe Sitron Libman, HO Janice Weil Libman,  FO 2
Libman, Ben 20 Aug 1896 11 Jul 1971 25-TT-4 VSPO  
  SO Wm. & Ida France Libman, HO Phoebe, FO of Audrey & Alan
Libman, Clarence  2 Oct 1904  3 Mar 1983 25-WWW-3 SP  
  SO William & Ida France Libman, HO Adele, FO Robert & William
Libman, Janice Weil 23 May 1930 27 Sep 2005 25-TT-2   
  DO Julius & Fannie Livingston Weil, WO Alan Libman,  MO 2
Libman, Phoebe Sitron 29 Jan 1900 15 Jun 1966 25-TT-3 OP  
  DO Abraham & Rachel Bloom Sitron, WO Ben, MO Audrey Ann & Alan
Libman, Samuel Arthur  8 Sep 1902 26 Nov 1966 25-B-4 PS  
  SO William & Ida France Libman, 1st HO Jean Pivovitz Davis
Litman, Rachel Frank 10 Apr 1865 15 Oct 1948 24-52-6 P  
  DO Bernard Frank (B. San Francisco), WO Simon Litman
Litman, Simon 13 Oct 1873  7 May 1973 24-52-7 OP  
  B. Odessa Russia,  HO Rachel Frank
Loeb, Abraham  1 Aug 1840  4 Apr 1909 24-02-8 VPC  
  SO Raphael & Rose Loeb, HO Mathilde, Civil War vet (6th KY Inf, CSA)
Loeb, Blanche 18 Mar 1881  6 Sep 1971 24-02-1 OP  
  DO Abraham & Mathilda Wolf Loeb, Obituary shows death 8 Sep 1971
Loeb, Charles F. 14 Nov 1882 25 Mar 1963 M-3-C RP  
  SO Abraham & Mathilde Wolf Loeb,  HO Helen Wollstein Loeb
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Loeb, Florence (Flora) 25 Jan 1902 12 Mar 1903 24-03-1 O  
  DO Himan & Martha Loeb,  "Died Mar 12, 1903 aged 13M, 15D"
Loeb, Harry Clay 15 Dec 1874  9 Aug 1941 24-02-4 OP  
  SO Abraham & Mathilde Wolf Loeb.  Never married.
Loeb, Helen Wollstein 13 Nov 1907 10 Dec 1995 M-3-D O  
  DO Eugene H. & Frieda Gartner Wollstein, WO Charles F. Loeb
Loeb, Josie  9 Feb 1873 29 Jul 1944 24-02-3 OP  
  DO Abraham & Mathilde Wolf Loeb.  Never married.
Loeb, Mathilde Wolf 25 Dec 1849 24 Apr 1927 24-02-7 OP  
  DO Herman & Nanete De Valt Wolf. WO Abraham
Loeb, Rachel 25 Dec 1878 10 Sep 1951 24-02-2 OP  
  DO Abraham & Mathilda Wolf Loeb.  Never married.
Lowenstern, Barbara Alsfelder  6 Apr 1865 12 Jan 1939 24-47-4 OCR  
  Sister of Philip Alsfelder, WO Monroe Lowenstern
Lowenstern, Bettie 16 Jun 1834 21 Feb 1883 24-48-7   
  "Born in Hanover Ger", no obituary found.  Sister of Morris Lowenstern.
Lowenstern, Caroline Jericho 15 Jul 1838 19 Jan 1915 24-48-5 OCR  
  DO Moses Jericho, WO Morris Lowenstern, MO 4
Lowenstern, Monroe 10 Mar 1865 30 Sep 1934 24-47-5 OCR  
  SO Morris & Caroline Jerico Lowenstern, HO Barbara Alsfelder
Lowenstern, Morris 15 Jul 1836 19 Jun 1916 24-48-6 VRC  
  SO Philip (B. in Germany), HO Caroline Jerico,  Civil War Vet.
Lowenstern, Philip 20 Oct 1804 13 Jun 1871 24-48-8 OHR  
  "Born in Adlersen prov. Hannover"  Wife died in Germany
Lyons, Flora C.  7 Jun 1869 24 Jan 1958 24-B-7 O  
  WO Morris S. Lyons, MO Mrs Harry Sered, Chicago IL
Lyons, Morris S.  5 Jan 1862  2 Dec 1918 24-B-8 O  
  HO Flora, FO Mrs Harry Sered, Chicago IL
Mandel, Eli Benjamin 29 Oct 1917  3 Nov 1981 25-PP-2 OP  
  SO Harry & Jennie Adler Mandel, HO of Rose ‘Bebbe’ Mandel, FO Gayle
Mandel, Rose 24 Jan 1917 29 Mar 2010 25-PP-1 O  
  DO Joseph & Dora Mandelbaum Weinstein, WO Eli, MO Craig, Gayle
Marco, Jacob "Jack" 18 Feb 1905  4 Mar 1978 25-RR-6 OPH  
  SO Hyman & Yetta Sax Marco, HO Sadye Zimmerman, FO Jewel Kurland
Marco, Sadye Zimmerman  3 Feb 1905  4 Sep 1999 25-RR-5 O  
  DO Morris & Mathlie Rabovsky Zimmerman, WO Jacob Marco  MO 2
Marcus, (Infant) 27 Nov 1943 27 Nov 1943 24-19-6 x  
  Bd 28 Nov 1943, Child of Henry & Dorothy Marcus
Marx, Werner  9 May 1923  3 Feb 1965 25-O-3 VO  
  SO Arthur Marx, HO Miriam, FO Ellen, Fred, Lawrence. WW II (USN)
Maus, Hugh Martin 11 Sep 1912 26 Sep 2002 25-II-5 O  
  SO Rudolph & Rose Ehrman Maus, HO Zelda Hamburg FO Sandra Beard
Maus, Zelda 17 Mar 1912 19 Sep 2001 25-II-6 O  
  DO Reuben & Dora Zarachovsky Hamburg, WO Hugh M Maus, MO Sandra
Mayorwitz, Arthur 20 Sep 1914 15 Jun 1988 25-DDD-1   
  SO Morris & Rose Mittleider Mayorwitz, FO Leslie & Mark
McGavran, Frederick 19 Jan 1956 9 May 2010 25-FFF-3 O  
  BIL Samuel Feinberg, SO Raymond & Julia McGavran
Meis, Clara B.    1888 12 Apr 1944 24-54-4 O  
  "Mother"  WO Milton M. Meis, MO Herschel & Herbert
Meis, Milton M. 28 Jan 1875 30 Oct 1931 24-54-1 O  
  "Father"  HO Clara B. Meis, FO Herschel & Herbert
Meyer, Esther 14 May 1829 30 Apr 1914 24-46-5 O  
  "Grandma" MO Bette Schiller, Aunt of Benjamin & Louis Bing
Meyer, Meyer    1793  2 Apr 1875 24-46-8   
  Stone is very worn, other information present but hard to read
Mirensky, Boris 18 Oct 1918 26 Oct 2002 24-B07-1 OV  
  SO Yankel & Vera Mirensky, HO Polya Gorelik, Soviet Army, WWII
Molasky, Sandra 21 Sep 1940 27 Dec 2014 25-PP-3 Ox  
  DO Edward Arnold Shapiro and Florence Ethel Sanders
Morhaim, Isaac 10 Feb 1922 2 Jan 2010 25-G-4 OV  
  HO Ruth Meyerson, FO Robert
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Movshovich, Faina (Fruma) 20 Jan 1917  1 Mar 2003 24-B06-1 O  
  MO Yeugenya Movshovich and Larisa Ariel-Shihlieva
Newman, Beverly 02 Jul 1934 11 May 2009 24-C06-4 O  
  DO Herman & Tillie Levoff Rooth, WO Ralph Newman, MO 2
Newman, Ralph 23 Aug 1932 24 Feb 2010 24-C06-3 O  
  SO Sidney & Molly Lewis Newman, HO Beverly Rooth, FO 2
Newmark, (Infant boy)  8 Apr 1939  8 Apr 1939 24-19-6 Ox  
  SO Nathan M. & Ann Mae Cohen Newmark.
Norian, Leah 10 Apr 1893  7 Oct 1983 25-EEE-6 O  
  "Beloved Mother" DO Frank & Dora Leb Chanen, WO William Norian
Pearlman, Sonya Garber 15 Mar 1895 23 Mar 1972 25-A-1 OP  
  nee Garber, WO Isadore Wm. Perlman, MO Helen (Levin), Raymond
Peterman, Emily Sara 20 Sep 1977 6 Oct 2013 24-A23-1 Dx  
  DO Henry M. & Elizabeth A. Schlanger Peterman, WO Brian Mann
Privina, Sarra 19 Nov 1924 27 Nov 2011 25-U-6   
  MO Bella Roginsky and Rebecca Privin
Reichman, Alfred H. 20 Aug 1911 20 Mar 1985 24-44-9 VO  
  SO Harry & Anna Reichman, Brother of Philip.  WW II Veteran
Reichman, Anna Bucky 20 Aug 1884 22 Nov 1947 24-44-7 O  
  DO Barnet & Anne Bradford Bucky, WO Harry, MO Alfred H.,Phil
Reichman, Harry 24 Aug 1874  6 Aug 1958 24-44-8 O  
  HO Anna Bucky, FO Alfred H. and Phil
Reichman, Philip Edward  2 Apr 1914  3 Apr 2000 24-54-7 DV  
  SO Harry & Anna Bucky Reichman, HO Dorothy Simpson, USA WWII
Reineberg, Amelia Adler 13 Jul 1893 16 Apr 1963 24-52-3 P  
  DO Adolph A. & Carrie W. Adler,  MO Carlyn (Mrs Kurt) Gottschalk
Reineberg, Lee W. 20 Mar 1891 16 Apr 1946 24-52-4 P  
  HO Amelia Adler,  Father of Carlyn (Mrs Kurt) Gottschalk
Rezits, Albert D. 12 Aug 1898  2 Dec 1987 25-G-2 VRO  
  SO David & Mary Pearl Rezits, HO Jennet Siegfried, WWI veteran
Rezits, Eva Marie 26 May 1895 17 Sep 1967 25-F-2 OR  
  DO Julius & Clara Pearl, WO Irwin Rezits
Rezits, I. Irwin 12 Jul 1894 14 Aug 1970 25-F-3 R  
  SO David & Mary Pearl Rezits, HO Eva Marie Pearl, no obit found
Rezits, Jennet Siegfried 26 Jul 1897 20 Feb 1988 25-G-1 OR  
  DO Joseph & Fannie Landau Siegfried, WO Albert Rezits, MO Joseph
Rigberg, Albert Edward 28 Dec 1910  2 Sep 2001 25-SSS-5 V  
  SO Morris & Anna Moteles Rigberg, USAAF WWII, DDS
Rigberg, Rose 19 May 1910 24 May 2000 25-SSS-6 O  
  DO Benjamin & Fannie Gordon Lipman, MO Frances Baker, GMO 2
Rimson, Rosa 12 Jun 1886 23 Oct 1918 24-20-1 OH  
  WO David Rimson, MO four children, Died in influenza epidemic
Rodkin, Philip Craig  3 Mar 1968  6 May 2014 24-C08-2 Ox  
  SO Larry & Avril Rodkin, HO Karla Fischer, FO Noah Rodkin-Fischer
Roginsky, Bella 10 Jun 1958 24 Apr 2012 25-U-1 O  
  DO Sarra Privina, WO Vladimir Roginsky
Romero, Lionel "Rick" 29 Aug 1932 10 Feb 1998 25-I-2 V  
  SO Pedro & Esperanza Aquilar Romero, HO Susan, FO 4, USAF Korea
Rosenfield, Myer Joseph  8 Dec 1922  9 Apr 1998 25-EEE-3 VO  
  SO Lena Omansky & Abraham L. Rosenfield, HO Eva Riaff, USA WWII
Rubin, Leo Mier    1868 18 Oct 1938 24-19-4 OH  
  B. Poland, HO Peaza Rubin, FO 4 sons and 5 daughters
Sapoznik, Edith 26 Dec 1916 10 Mar 2000 25-GG-3 O  
  DO Phillip & Buelah Whorten Nelson, WO Henry, MO Markham
Sapoznik, Henry William  2 Feb 1912  7 Oct 1999 25-GG-4 O  
  SO Morris & Rose Sapoznik, HO Edith Nelson, FO Markham
Schiller, Bettie (Rebecca) 29 Apr 1849  1 Nov 1906 24-46-6 O  
  "Mamma" DO Esther Meyer, Obituary has birthdate of 29 Apr 1853
Schiller, Rose 19 Jun 1874 19 Jan 1906 24-46-7 O  
  "Her daughter" DO Bettie Schiller, father died near her birth
Scholl, Jean Dorothy 24 Apr 1904 25 Jan 1975 25-OO-3   
  DO James & Sara Scholl, Aunt of Norman Barnett, no obit found
Schwartz, Edith Westel 25 Nov 1888 24 Oct 1973 25-OO-2   
  DO Jacob & Blume Westel, MO Bernice Wax

23



        Name                                                                                     B orn                        Died                       Plot                  Notes
  

Schwartz, Joan Kaufman 19 May 1927 15 Dec 2013 24-D-5 Ox  
  DO Stanley & Josephine Kaufman, MO Chuck and Linda
Schwarz, Grete  9 Jan 1888  9 Aug 1983 24-B-2   
  WO Heinrich, B. Germany, Died in Florida.  No obituary found
Schwarz, Heinrich 21 May 1881  2 Jan 1943 24-B-1 O  
  "Born in Germany" To US 1941, HO Grete, FO Dr Guenther Schwarz
Schwarz, Sarah Adler  3 Jan 1850  6 Nov 1893 24-04-6 O  
  Nee Adler.  "Born Lawrenceburg IN" , WO Albert Schwarz, MO 4
Seid, Talia Benna 12 Sep 1993 12 Sep 1993 25-BBB-1 O  
  DO Michael & Cynthia Ruth Palmer Seid
Selicovitz,  (infant) 1910    Sep 1910 24-28-1 x  
  From Cemetery records, buried 6 Sep 1910
Selicovitz, Abe L. 10 Aug 1898 27 Aug 1977 25-P-3 OPS  
  SO Moses & Nettie, HO Esther, Soc. Sec. shows 1899 as birth year
Selicovitz, Abraham abt 1855 17 Jul 1928 24-27-8 Ox  
  HO Bessie, BO Moses, FO Rose & Harry
Selicovitz, Bessie 10 Apr 1856 25 Feb 1927 24-27-7 O  
  WO Abraham Selicovitz,  MO Rose (Nathan) & Harry
Selicovitz, Esther Conwisher 19 Feb 1901 17 Oct 1986 25-P-2 OS  
  DO Max & Ann Conwisher, WO Abe L. Selicovitz
Selicovitz, Fannie 19 May 1903 31 May 1903 24-28-1w Ox  
  DO Moses & Nettie S. Selicovitz,  Buried in NW corner of plot
Selicovitz, Hyman  2 Jan 1901 24 Jun 1903 24-28-1e Dx  
  From cemetery records, buried 6 Sep 1910
Selicovitz, Louis 28 Jan 1916 25 Feb 1919 24-27-3 ODx  
  SO Moses & Nettie, No monument, Died in influenza epidemic
Selicovitz, Moses    1873    Feb 1949 24-27-4   
  Bd 16 Feb 1949, HO Nettie Selicovitz. no obituary found
Selicovitz, Nettie Selicovitz    1881  9 Jan 1946 24-27-5 O  
  nee Selicovitz, Niece & WO Moses, MO Abe,Joe,Mollie,Lena,Sylvia
Seligman, Alex S. 10 Apr 1880 11 Oct 1946 24-19-1 O  
  "Father"  HO Sarah (Selma) Gans, FO Carl Selby, Martha Billings
Seligman, Lester G.  6 Feb 1918  2 Nov 2004 24-C03-4 OV  
  SO Samuel B. and Reva Greenspan Seligman, HO Judith Wisotzky
Seligman, Sarah Gans 19 Jun 1883 28 Sep 1971 24-19-2 O  
  "Mother"  WO Alex S. Seligman, MO Carl Selby, Dr Martha Billings
Shapiro, Milton Taub  4 May 1912  8 Sep 2003 24-A10-4 O  
  SO Max & Kate Tauh Shapiro, FO Michael & David
Shapiro, Rebecca Evelyn 13 Sep 1913 22 Jun 2002 24-A10-3 O  
  DO David & Yetta Krulick Piesner, MO Michael & David
Shmikler, Alice R. 23 Aug 1914  1 Oct 1969 25-J-4 S  
  DO Abe & Anna Goldsmith (Mattoon)  1st WO Joe Shmikler
Shmikler, Daniel Myron 28 Aug 1951 28 Aug 1951 25-J-1   
  "Son of Gilbert & Marion Shmikler", Grandson of Samuel & Jennie
Shmikler, Jennie 15 Jan 1893 24 Nov 1973 25-J-5 OS  
  DO Morris & Rachel Zimberoff Leavitt, WO Samuel, MO 5
Shmikler, Joseph  2 Jul 1915 16 Dec 1995 25-J-3 x  
  SO Sam & Jennie Shmikler, HO Alice, FO Reva Myers, Cheryl Murray
Shmikler, Raymond  7 Nov 1919 18 Jul 1983 25-J-2 VO  
  SO Samuel & Jennie Leavitt Shmikler.  WW II veteran
Shmikler, Samuel 14 Apr 1886 30 Jan 1953 25-J-6 OP  
  HO Jennie Leavitt, FO Joseph, Gilbert, William, Raymond, Norma
Sholem, Faye S. 25 Jan 1900  6 Feb 1985 M-2-D PS  
  DO Harry & Bessie Siegal, WO Jerome J. Sholem, MO Mike, Stanford
Sholem, Jerome J. 20 Oct 1895 31 Jan 1975 M-2-C PS  
  SO William & Flora Sholem, HO Faye Siegal Sholem
Shoresman, David Adam 10 Sep 1969 10 Oct 2001 24-A09-4 O  
  SO Peter Shoresman & Sandra Hiller Shoresman Hynds
Siegel, Ivens A. 28 Jan 1932  14 Oct 2014 25-XX-1 O  
  SO Nathan & Rose Siegel, HO Naomi Halpern & Jean Talley, FO 3
Siegel, Naomi 24 Apr 1929  4 May 1999 25-XX-2 OP  
  DO Morris & Libby Geffen Halpern, WO Ivens Siegel, MO 3, GMO 6
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Silverman, Brian C. 02 Aug 1943 23 Nov 2011 25-NNN-6 O  
  SO Mary Cutler & Isadore Silverman, HO Ilene Corman
Silverman, Charles O. 15 Jul 1916 11 Mar 1991 25-AA-4 VOP  
  SO Morris & Blema Alteresco Silverman, HO Dorothy Brown, WW II
Silverman, Dorothy 28 Jan 1917 22 Oct 1983 25-AA-3 OSP  
  DO Benjamin & Mary Ann Landsberg Brown, WO Charles, MO Judi,Rbt.
Simon, Abraham 14 Mar 1888 21 Feb 1952 24-44-6 O  
  "Abraham ben Mikhael" HO Sima, FO Max, Dorothy (Mrs Alvin Sosin)
Simon, Abraham 24 Dec 1888  7 Oct 1964 25-MM-6 OS  
  SO Aaron & Rebecca Haiden Shimel, HO Lenore Levy Simon, FO 3
Simon, Dora Banks    1885 23 Feb 1919 24-A-2 O  
  "In Loving Remembrance", nee Banks, WO Hyman, MO Marie, Charles
Simon, Hyman    1875 18 Dec 1936 24-A-1 O  
  SO Aaron & Rebecca Haidon Shimel, HO Dora Banks Simon, FO 2
Simon, Jack Aaron 17 Jun 1919 17 Dec 2005 25-MM-4 OV  
  SO Abraham and Lenore Levy Simon
Simon, Lenore Levy 29 May 1895  6 Apr 1984 25-MM-5 OPS  
  DO Nissim Isaac (David) & Jeanette Cohen Levy, WO Abraham, MO 3
Simon, Sima 17 Apr 1896 13 Apr 1971 24-44-5 OH  
  WO Abraham ben Michael Simon, MO Max Simon, Dorothy Sosi
Simonson, David Jeffrey 23 Oct 1934 21 Dec 1934 24-A-2 O  
  SO Hymen & Marie Simon Simonson.  Buried at foot of Dora Simon
Simonson, Hymen Francis 20 Feb 1903  3 Jun 1956 25-E-3 OP  
  SO Samuel & Sarah Simonson, HO Marie Ann Simon, FO Judy, Doris
Simonson, Marie Ann Simon 31 Oct 1905 29 May 1983 25-E-2 OP  
  DO Hyman & Dora Banks Simon, WO Hymen F. Simonson, MO Judy,Doris
Sirkis, Susan Melanie 29 Mar 1955 13 Nov 1968 25-EE-3 P  
  DO Murray D. & Dolores Sirkis (Tempe AZ)
Slottow, Hiram Gene  1 May 1921 11 Mar 1989 25-DDD-5 P  
  SO Fanchon & H. Gene Slottow Sr,  HO Irene Gullan Slottow
Smith, Tammy Robin 19 Mar 1961 29 Jan 1996 24-30-1 O  
  DO Arlen & Joan Rosenblum Tepper, MO Richard L. & Shawn Smith
Sorkin, Alex  6 Aug 1937 26 Feb 1998 25-PPP-2 OV  
  SO Sidney & Nettie Horwitz Sorkin, U.S. Army (Vietnam era) 
Sorkin, Nettie 26 May 1914  3 Jan 1999 25-PPP-2 O  
  DO Phillip & Gertrude Cohen Horowitz, WO Sidney, MO Carol & Alex
Sorkin, Sidney 13 Aug 1911 12 Apr 2002 25-PPP-2 O  
  HO Nettie Horwitz, FO Alex & Carol
Steigmann, Anna Ruth 29 Jan 1910 18 Sep 2006 25-FFF-1 O  
  WO Frederick, MO Judith, Richard, Robert
Steigmann, Frederick 25 Apr 1905  4 Jul 1998 25-FFF-2 VO  
  HO Ruth Dibblee S., FO Judith, Richard, Robert, WW II USN
Steinberg, Marvin Phillip  4 Oct 1922 23 Jan 1990 25-LL-6 SPH  
  SO Louis Isaac & Jennie Steinberg,  HO Esther Reizman Steinberg
Stern, (Infant girl)        1918        1918 24-24-4   
  "Baby", Bd 30 Jul 1918,  Likely DO Walter & Ethel, no obit found
Stern, Abraham  1 Mar 1838 31 Jul 1901 24-24-8 OPR  
  HO Babette Bloch Stern, FO Nathanial,Albert L.,Delia,Walter W.
Stern, Albert Leland 15 Feb 1875 16 Dec 1969 24-24-3 RP  
  SO Abraham & Babette Bloch Stern. HO Meme Alpiner Stern
Stern, Albert W.  3 Dec 1915 18 Jul 1986 24-29-2 VP  
  SO Walter W. & Ethel Bower Stern, HO Marjorie
Stern, Alpiner L. 14 Oct 1902  3 Sep 1919 24-24-1 P  
  "Beloved son of Albert L. & Amelia D.A. Stern"
Stern, Babette Adelaide Bloch 19 May 1854  6 Jan 1932 24-24-7 OP  
  WO Abraham, MO Nathaniel, Albert L., Delia (Stipes) & Walter W.
Stern, Ethel Carey Bower 18 Dec 1886 17 Dec 1959 24-23-7 RP  
  DO Jacob & Rosa Bondi Bower. WO Walter, MO Albert,Walter,Eugene
Stern, Harriet Solomon "Weesie"  4 Aug 1918  2 Aug 1953 24-23-5 OP  
  DO Julius Solomon (OH). WO of Walter Stern Jr., MO Barbara, Jon
Stern, Lawrence 18 Jun 1949 24-44-1 m  
  From cemetery records, buried 20 Jun 1949, removed 3 Feb 1950
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Stern, Marjorie  7 Jun 1917 20 Aug 1970 24-29-7 VO  
  DO Jay & Bess Icenogle Gould, WO Albert W. Stern.  WW II (WAVE)
Stern, Meme (Amelia D.) Alpiner  8 Mar 1874 12 May 1969 24-24-2 P  
  DO Solomon & Henrietta Felsenphal Alpiner.  WO Albert L. Stern
Stern, Nathan  6 Mar 1836 25 Oct 1923 24-24-6 O  
  Brother of Abraham Stern and Mrs Sam Eichberg.
Stern, Walter W. 27 Aug 1877 10 Jun 1942 24-23-8 OP  
  SO Abraham & Babette, HO Ethel B., FO Albert, Walter Jr & Eugene
Stern, Walter Wolf, Jr 18 Dec 1912 11 Nov 1999 24-23-6 OV  
  SO Walter Sr & Ethel Bower Stern, HO Harriet, FO 2
Sternberg, John N.    1866        1944 24-B-3   
  "Father"  Bd 8 Mar 1944, No obituary or death notice found
Storch, Nicole Anne  9 Aug 1942 18 Aug 2005 25-MMM-3 O  
  DO Marvin & Laura Levine Dubin, MO Joseph and Jocelyn
Storch, Stephen David 26 Dec 1939 20 Mar 2000 25-MMM-2 O  
  SO Joseph & Sophia Stimmel Storch, HO Nicole Dubin Storch, FO 2
Sudman, Seymour  9 Aug 1928  2 May 2000 25-FFF-6 OV  
  SO Harry & Fannie Shulman Sudman, HO Blanche Berland S., FO 3
Talley, Edward S. 22 Jan 1966 14 Feb 2005 24-54-8 OV  
  SO James A. Talley, Jr & Jean Gomez Siegel
Tanner, Bertha Louise  9 Feb 1916 20 Dec 2003 M-1-F O  
  DO Abe & Anna Solomon Goldsmith, WO Lewis, MO Judy
Tanner, Lewis 21 Sep 1915 19 May 1995 M-1-E VO  
  SO Harry & Lena Gudder Tanner, HO Bertha Goldsmith, FO Judy, WW2
Tepper, Anna Fink  2 Feb 1880 21 Feb 1963 24-30-7 OHP  
  WO David, MO Manie, Max, Fannie T. Kohn, & Pearl T. Feldman
Tepper, Beatrice 24 Jun 1908 21 Apr 2005 24-30-2 O  
  DO Aron & Minnie Borodiansky Rosenstein, WO Manie Tepper
Tepper, David 31 May 1877 29 Feb 1952 24-30-8 OHP  
  HO Anna, FO Manie, Max, Fannie (Kohn) & Pearl (Feldman)
Tepper, Fay 28 Apr 1917 26 Feb 2005 25-M-1 OP  
  DO Isaac & Helen Toig Tepper, WO Max Tepper, MO 4
Tepper, Manie 24 Sep 1903  5 May 1962 24-30-3 OP  
  SO David & Anna Fink Tepper, HO Bea Rosenstein, FO 3
Tepper, Max 18 Jun 1905 31 Aug 1961 25-M-2 P  
  SO David & Anna Fink Tepper, HO Fay Tepper Tepper, FO 4
Tepper, Michael 9 Oct 1941 19 Aug 2007 24-A07-4 O  
  SO Manie & Beatrice Rosenstein Tepper, HO Buddi Alex Tepper
Tuckman, Morris    1892 26 Nov 1923 24-20-4 OH  
  Born in Russia, Father of Annie and Ruby
Waisvisz, David  9 Mar 1967 21 May 2004 24-C10-2   
  SO Vera Reiss & Herman Edward Waisvisz
Waldbauer, Stephanie Stiefel 11 Jun 1932 28 Aug 1998 24-54-5 O  
  DO Henryk and Gustawa Engel Stiefel, WO Gilbert Waldbauer, MO 2
Walter, Jane Prashker  3 Apr 1932 25 Nov 1987 25-CCC-1 OHP  
  "Zehava", DO Harry & Ruth Martin Prashker, WO John H. Walter
Wax, Bernice S. 12 Jan 1918 28 Jun 2006 25-WW-3 O  
  WO Nelson, MO Ruth, David & Saul
Wax, David Westel 24 May 1952    May 1978 25-WW-6   
  SO Nelson & Bernice Schwartz Wax
Wax, Nelson  2 Apr 1917 13 Jan 1992 25-WW-5 O  
  SO Samuel & Hinda Kaminker Wax, HO Bernice, FO Ruth,David,Saul
Weichsel, Lisa Ellen 21 Jan 1963  1 Nov 1966 25-SS-1 PH  
  "Sleep my Child"  DO Tauby Heller Shimkin & Paul Weichsel
Weingart, Debra Renee 18 Dec 1970 24 Jan 1971 25-DD-1   
  DO Rabbi Sam Weingart & Barbara Weingart
Weingarten, Florence Felsenthal 31 May 1873  8 Feb 1965 24-53-2 ORP  
  DO Rabbi Bernard Felsenthal. WO Samuel, MO Helen & Lawrence
Weingarten, Samuel  5 Jan 1865 27 Jan 1934 24-53-3 OP  
  HO Florence Felsenthal, FO Helen & Lawrence, Champaign clothier
Weisel, Anne Berman 6 Feb 1918 23 Mar 2015 24-B11-1 Ox  
  DO Benjamin & Esther Watman Berman, WO Leo Weisel, MO 4
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Weisel, Leo  8 Nov 1915  7 Dec 2003 24-B11-2 OV  
  SO William & Sarah Orlansky Weisel, US Navy WW II
Weiss, Friedericke 12 Jan 1869  2 Jan 1958 25-N-4 O  
  "Beloved Mother & Grandmother", MO Dr Otto Weiss of Mattoon
Weissman, Irving 29 Jan 1914 12 Nov 1985 25-YY-6 VOP  
  SO Herman & Rose Miller Weissman, HO Sonia Applebaum Weissman
Werthman, Ida 12 Apr 1894  1 Mar 1959 25-R-5 O  
  DO Bernard & Sophie Cohn, WO Gus Werthman, MO Ben,Louis,Stanley
Willis, Rosalie  1 Jun 1945  3 Mar 1997 25-G-6 OP  
  DO Jerry & Dorothy White Willis, b. Chicago IL
Winakor, Annette Wright  6 Jan 1905 23 Sep 1955 25-U-3 OP  
  DO Ben & Jennie Wright, WO Arthur, MO Thora Geitel & Bess Ruth
Winakor, Arthur H. 12 Dec 1903 25 Feb 1981 25-U-4 OP  
  SO Isaac & Gertrude Winakor, HO Annette Wright, FO Thora, Bess
Winakor, Bess Ruth 17 Mar 1942 13 Nov 2007 25-U-5 O  
  DO Arthur H. & Annette Wright Winakor
Winakor, Thora Geitel 29 Aug 1929 15 Aug 2011 25-U-2 O  
  DO Arthur H. & Annette Wright Winakor
Windmuller, Bertha Kahn 29 Mar 1895 16 Dec 1985 25-R-1 S  
  nee Kahn, WO Solomon Windmuller, no obituary found
Windmuller, Solomon 13 Jan 1886 14 Jun 1954 25-R-2 O  
  SO Philip & Sophie Windmuller, HO Bertha Kahn FO John P & Rudi
Wiseman, Joseph    1876  8 Oct 1938 24-19-7 O  
  From Indianapolis, FO Mrs Pearl Hellen (Detroit) and 3 more
Wolbach, June K. 10 Jul 1916 11 Oct 2005 25-SSS-2 Ox  
  DO David & Rose Grossman Kepler, MO Judy Bach, Rbt. Sonneborn
Wolff, Charles A. 23 Jul 1867 19 Dec 1948 24-01-1 OPR  
  SO David & Resa August Wolff, HO Lida Kuhn Wolff, FO 2
Wolff, Lida Kuhn 24 Jul 1874 27 Jan 1957 24-01-2 OPR  
  DO Joseph & Lena Loeb Kuhn, WO Charles A., MO David A. & Lenore
Wolff, Simon  1 Jan 1859  8 Nov 1924 Dm  
  SO Judah & Jeannette, HO Elsie, removed to Youngstown OH 1925  Was in 24-44-3
Woolfson, Esther Irene 24 May 1971 26 Dec 1971 25-DD-2 O  
  DO Jacob & Betty Krupp Woolfson, "Baby"
Youngerman, William Martin 23 Sep 1907  8 Oct 1975 24-22-5 VP  
  SO David & Zelda Youngerman, HO Ruth Kuhn, FO 3
Zibel, Leon  1 May 1891  4 Feb 1963 25-II-4 OH  
  SO Morris & Riva Kaplan Zibel, HO Lottie, FO Florence Dooley
Zibel, Lottie 12 Apr 1902 18 Jul 1975 25-II-3 OH  
  DO Rubin & Devorah Leah Hamburg, WO Leon, MO Florence Dooley
Zimmerman, Theodore  6 Dec 1913  3 May 1946 24-44-8 Om  
  From cemetery records, Bd 13 May, moved to Chicago 22 Jul 1947
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Jewish War Veterans Buried at Mount Hope

Research by the National Museum of American Jewish Military History indicates that Jewish men and women have served

in every war in which the United States was involved, including the Revolutionary War, in numbers greater than would

have been expected from their representation in the general population.  The following list includes those buried at Mount

Hope who have been identified as serving in the armed forces of the United States or its allies during a war period.  Arm

of service and branch are shown where known.  Other former members of the Champaign Jewish community are buried

at Arlington National Cemetery and the American Military Cemetery at Normandy.

    Civil War

Kuhn, Joseph

Loeb, Abraham  6th Kentucky Infantry

Lowenstern, Morris 

    World War I

Cohen, Julius B.  U.S. Army

Cohen, Sidney N.  U.S. Army

Cohen, Solomon B. U.S. Army

Libman, Ben  U.S. Army

Rezits, Albert D. U.S. Army

    World War II

Aprill, Jerome U.S. Army

Banks, Edwin Melvin  U.S. Navy

Berg, Morris U.S. Navy

Brill, Isidore (Irving)

Brown, Helen L.  U.S. Army (WAC)

Brown, Morris

Geffert, Alvin D.

Ginsberg,  Abraham Gerald   Canadian Army

Goldberg, Samuel I.  Canadian Army

Gordon, Louis   U.S. Army

Gorodinski, Iakov  Soviet Army

Greenman, Leonard  U.S. Marine Corps

Greenman, Myron  U.S. Army

Grossman, Morris

Hamburg, Alvin  U.S. Army

Hamburg, Joseph U.S. Army

Hays, Russell W.

Kaufman, Stanley Louis  

Koenigsberg, Viola  U.S. Army (WAC)

Kohn, Alfred   U.S. Army Air Forces

Kurland, Aaron   U.S. Navy

Kuznetsov, Nathan H.  Soviet Army

Lewin, Allen  U.S. Army

Lewis, Arthur  U.S. Army

Marx, Werner  U.S. Navy

Mirensky, Boris  Soviet Army

Reichman, Alfred H.

Reichman, Philip Edward  U.S. Army

Rigberg, Albert Edward  U.S. Army Air Forces

Rosenfield, Myer J.  U.S. Army

Seligman, Lester G.  U.S. Army

Shmikler, Raymond 

Silverman, Charles O.

Simon, Jack Aaron  U.S. Army Air Forces

Steigmann, Frederick  U.S. Navy

Stern, Albert W.  U.S. Army

Stern, Marjorie  U.S. Navy (WAVE)

Stern, Walter Wolf, Jr  U.S. Army Air Forces

Tanner, Lewis

Weisel, Leo  U.S. Navy

Weissman, Irving

Youngerman, William Martin U.S. Army Air Forces

    Cold War

Bloomfield, Daniel Kermit  U.S. Navy

Kulwin, Myron  U.S. Army Air Forces

Talley, Edward U.S. Army

    Korean War

Davis, Leonard Norman   U.S. Air Force

Glaser, Milton R.  U.S. Air Force (MC)

Greenman, Myron   U.S. Army

Kling, Blair U.S. Army

Morhaim, Isaac U. S. Army (MC)

Newman, Ralph  U.S. Air Force

Romero, Lionel "Rick"  U.S. Air Force

Sudman, Seymour  U.S. Army

    Vietnam War

Sorkin, Alex   U.S. Army
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